VILLAGE OF LAKE BLUFF
ARCHITECTURAL BOARD OF REVIEW

TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 2, 2016 — 7:00 P.M.

VILLAGE HALL BOARD ROOM
40 E. CENTER AVENUE, LAKE BLUFF, ILLINOIS

AGENDA

1. Call to Order and Roll Call

2. Consideration of the January 5, 2016 Architectural Board of Review Meeting
Minutes

3. Non-Agenda Items and Visitors (Public Comment Time)
The Architectural Board of Review Chair and Board Members allocate fifteen (15) minutes during this
item for those individuals who would like the opportunity to address the Board on any matter not listed
on the agenda. Each person addressing the Architectural Board of Review is asked to limit their
comments to a maximum of three (3) minutes.

4. A Public Hearing to Consider a Site Plan to Review Changes to the Exterior of
the Building and Signage for Hansa Coffee Roasters at 600 Walnut Avenue

5. A Continuation of a Public Hearing to Consider a Site Plan to Review Changes
to the Lake Bluff Middle School at 31 E Sheridan Place

6. A Public Hearing to Consider a Site Plan to Review Changes to Light Fixtures
for the Paddle Courts at Blair Park, 355 W Washington Avenue

7. Consideration of a Sign Permit for Dold for Congress Office at 999 Sherwood
Drive

8. A Discussion of Potential Streetscape Improvements to the Southeast Corner
of Scranton Avenue and Center Avenue

9. A Public Hearing to Consider Building Code Updates

10. Staff Report
e Workshop Meeting—Tuesday, February 9, 2016

e Next Regular Meeting — March 1, 2016 (1%t Tuesday)

11. Adjournment

The Village of Lake Bluff is subject to the requirements of the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990. Individuals with disabilities
who plan to attend this meeting and who require certain accommodations in order to allow them to observe and/or participate in this
meeting, or who have questions regarding the accessibility of the meeting or the facilities, are requested to contact R. Drew Irvin at
234-0774 or TDD number 234-2153 promptly to allow the Village of Lake Bluff to make reasonable accommodations.


http://www.lakebluff.org/sitemedia/documents/Title_9_Building_Regulations.pdf

VILLAGE OF LAKE BLUFF
ARCHITECTURAL BOARD OF REVIEW
REGULAR MEETING
JANUARY 5, 2016

DRAFT MINUTES

1. Call to Order and Roll Call
The meeting of the Architectural Board of Review (ABR) of the Village of Lake Bluff was
called to order on January 5, 2016 at 7:00 p.m. in the Village Hall Board Room (40 E. Center
Avenue) and the following were present.

Present: Neil Dahlmann
Matthew Kerouac
Carol Russ
John Sorenson
Bob Hunter, Chair

Absent: Ed Deegan, Member
Steve Rappin, Member

Also Present: Mike Croak, Building Codes Supervisor (BCS)

2. Consideration of the December 1, 2015 ABR Meeting
Member Dahlmann moved to approve the minutes of the December 1, 2015 ABR meeting as
presented. Member Kerouac seconded the motion. The motion passed on a unanimous voice
vote.

3. Consideration of the December 16, 2015 ABR Workshop Meeting
Member Dahlmann moved to approve the minutes of the December 16, 2015 ABR Workshop
meeting as presented. Member Kerouac seconded the motion. The motion passed on a
unanimous voice Vvote.

4. Non-Agenda Items and Visitors (Public Comment Time)
Chair Hunter stated the ABR Chair and Board Members allocate fifteen minutes during this
item for those individuals who would like the opportunity to address the Board on any matter
not listed on the agenda. There were no request to address the ABR.

5. A Discussion of Potential Building Code Updates

BCS Michael Croak stated Village ordinances requires us to consider the adoption of the latest
building codes every three years to stay current with the latest technology. Staff also reviewed
the local amendments by which the codes are adopted and noted builders have expressed issues
regarding permit renewals. Currently, Section 9-1-9 of the Municipal Code provides that
permits expire one year after issuance, unless a longer time is specified on the face of the
permit, and if an extension is needed the applicant must pay an additional 50% of the original
permit fee for a six month extension. He proposed a monthly renewal that would be less
burdensome while still incentivizing timely completion.




ABR Regular Meeting Minutes —
January 5, 2016

In response to a question from Chair Hunter, BCS Croak stated the Village does require bonds
for large exterior projects in the right-of-way but not for smaller projects on private property.
A discussion ensued regarding the permit renewals.

BCS Croak provided a list of the model codes currently adopted and the proposed 2015 codes.

BCS Croak recommended adoption of the 2015 edition of International Building Code with
most of the same amendments that we had for 2012 edition, except for the amendment adopted
in 2010 requiring fire rated partitions within a building be constructed of masonry because it
has not proven to be practical.

BCS Croak stated Illinois State law mandates that construction projects for which permits are
submitted on or after January 1, 2016 must comply with the 2015 edition of the International
Energy Conservation Code. BCS Croak provided the ABR with a summary list of the
significant changes from 2012 to 2015 of the International Energy Conservation Code.

In response to a comment from Member Sorenson regarding the heated water circulation
systems, BCS Croak stated the demand activated circulation systems is a new requirement.
The systems is designed to save water and energy because it prevents cold water from sitting in
the pipes. A discussion followed.

BCS Croak provided information regarding the Illinois Plumbing Code requirements and noted
the Illinois Department of Natural Resources advised that all communities that use Lake
Michigan water are required by State law to establish plumbing code amendments requiring
new plumbing fixtures to be Water Sense labeled for water conservation and required to
prohibit the irrigation of lawns during a six hour time period in the middle of the day.
Currently, Section 8-1D-4 of the Lake Bluff Code prohibits watering for a five hour time period
from 12:01 PM to 5:00 PM. Staff recommends amending the time to 11:00 AM to 5:00 PM.
The Lake Bluff’s municipal code refers to the 2004 edition of the Illinois Plumbing Code.
Since the State has published a 2014 edition to the Illinois Plumbing Code, we will amend the
municipal code to refer to the latest edition. He stated one of the more controversial changes to
the Illinois Plumbing Code is that it now allows polyethylene tubing (PEX) for water supply
piping. Staff recommends that we maintain our existing plumbing material restrictions, which
are similar to those of neighboring communities, and which require copper pipe for water
supply. A discussion followed.

BCS Croak stated State law requires new residential construction to provide a radon mitigation
system (passive or active venting) since June 1, 2013; however, the Village never formally
adopted the requirements. Staff recommends adopting these requirements into the Lake Bluff
Code so the Village will have the authority to enforce these requirements.

Member Sorenson provided information regarding radon installation, a discussion followed.

Member Sorenson questioned if the plumbing fixtures should be labeled water sense and if that
was the current mandated requirement. BCS Croak stated the EPA has set a water conversation
program that has some standards regarding water sense labels. A discussion ensued regarding
replacement of water fixtures in historic structures.



ABR Regular Meeting Minutes —
January 5, 2016

BCS Croak provided the ABR with the proposed changes to the 2014 National Electrical Code
and noted that among the most significant changes is the GFCI protection for dwelling unit
laundry areas and commercial garages. A discussion followed.

As there were no questions from the public, BCS Croak stated the next step in the process is to
conduct a public hearing and submitted the ABR recommendations to the Village Board for
consideration.

Chair Hunter stated the ABR and Joint Plan Commission and Zoning Board of Appeals
recently held a workshop meeting and received a presentation from Teska Association on the
draft design guidelines for CBD Blocks Two and Three.

In response to a comment from Member Kerouac, BCS Croak stated the area is split into two
zoning districts, the west end located in the CBD and the east end with parking in the
residential district.

A discussion regarding the building height, underground parking, setback and streetscape
followed.

Member Dahlmann asked about Block One streetscape plans for the sidewalks, street lamps,
etc. Chair Hunter stated there have been comments that some of the materials used in the Block
One streetscape may be hard to repair.

Maureen Chamberlain, a resident of North Avenue, expressed concern regarding the proposed
developments for the area. She stated it would make sense for such a building to be built in a
difference space as it is not in keeping with the neighborhood.

Chair Hunter commented on Lake Forest downtown configuration which consists of apartment

buildings located across from a residential area. A discussion ensued regarding density, diverse
housing and building height. Chair Hunter stated we do not want to duplicate Block One.

6. Staff Report
BCS Croak reported the next regular meeting will be on February 2, 2016.

7. Adjournment
There being no further business to consider, Member Dahlmann moved to adjourn the meeting.

Member Russ seconded the motion. The motion passed on a unanimous voice vote.

The meeting adjourned.

Respectfully submitted,

Mike Croak, CBO, CBCO
Building Codes Supervisor



VILLAGE OF LAKE BLUFF

Memorandum

TO: Chairman Hunter and Members of the Architectural Board of Review
FROM: Mike Croak, Building Codes Supervisor

DATE: February 2, 2016

SUBJECT: Agenda Item #4 - A Public Hearing to Consider a Site Plan to Review Changes to the
Exterior of the Building and Signage for Hansa Coffee Roasters at 600 Walnut Avenue

Hansa Coffee Roasters is the proposed new tenant of Lake Effect Holdings, LLC, the owner of the building at 600
Walnut Avenue. Since this use is a special use, they have applied for a special use permit and that request will be
considered by the PC/ZBA and Village Board.

They propose to add four sets of shutters, an awning with three valence signs, and two window signs to the east
elevation of the building.

They are proposing a sign on the east valance of the awning reading, “Hansa Coffee Roasters,” and signs on the
north and south valances reading, “Hansa Coffee.” The Sign Code only allows one awning sign per business (even
in a corner building where two wall signs are permitted) so these three signs will require an exemption from this
requirement.

The following is a chart summarizing the measurements of the proposed signs:

Sign Code CBD Proposed Signage

1.) One awning sign permitted per business Exemption Requested to allow 3 awning signs

2.) Letters on the awning are to be between 5” & 7” tall Complies

3.) Awning lettering shall be on descending skirt only Complies

4.) Window Signage allowed up to 15% of window area Complies—13.36% proposed
Recommendation:

It is recommended the ABR conduct a public hearing to consider modification to the site plan and signage plan,
appropriately question the Petitioner as needed, entertain public comments and questions from the petitioner
and make one of the following recommendations regarding the site plan:

e Recommend that the Village Board approve the proposed site plan as presented or with conditions;
e Recommend that the Village Board deny the proposed site plan; or
e Request the petitioner to provide additional information for the ABR’s consideration.

At the conclusion of the public hearing, it is recommended that the ABR take one of the following actions with

respect to the signage plan:
=  Recommend the Village Board grant or deny an exemption from the Sign Code regulations for the

signage as presented;




*  Approve the sign permit (with conditions) that complies with all Code regulations; or
= Deny the sign permit.

Rob Douglas of Lake Effect Holdings and Village Staff will be in attendance at Tuesday’s meeting to respond to
questions from the ABR. If you should have any questions regarding this matter, please feel free to contact me at
847-283-6885.



fecl

Hovrpiwnaegs, LLC

lake

S

January 11, 2016

Mr. Robert Hunter

Village of Lake Bluff Architectural Board of Review
40 East Center Avenue

Lake BlIuff, lllinois 60044

Dear Mr Hunter,
Re: ABR Site Plan Review - 600 Walnut Avenue

Attached you will find 13 copies of a submittal for Site Plan review with the Lake Bluff
Architectural Review Board. Included in the submittal is a site plan, awning fabric samples, and
building elevations. What Lake Effect Holdings is requesting the approval of the following
modifications to the building commonly known as the Village Market Building (Resolution 2006 -
9):

» The addition of an awning over the exterior stairs into the retail space, 600 Walnut Avenue.

« The application of signage to be located on the valence of the awning. Signage will also be
applied on the south side of the awning.

« The installation of the logo of the new business on the store front windows.

» The addition of four sets of shutters to the exterior of the building.

At the Village of Lake Bluff ARB meeting | will be more than happy to answer any additional
questions as it pertains to the attached requests.

Cordially,
LAKE EFFECT HOLDINGS, LLC

Robert D. Dougla
Managing Member

cC: Mike Croak
Brandon Stanick



(L€ 4900500 ybnoiy | Aep)

SYUOW JBWWINS 3y} 10} uoieInbijuoo pasodold

WO LD AN §89b FT- Lty

D)

H
H
&
§
2

_cH e

SSION [eRUSD

1950}
g

Jusluasey

Auados,

T WNIGONET ANUIAY INUBM. 009

Buiping
1B abeliA
ayL

VAR
\/\

IRVRVAF])

|

A

7

#

7

/

CITESEL

.
L ——

7,,

R

QIETT

Vi



: Mark of Excd[mee
RN SELECTIO
DOCRIL DOCRIL WATER REPELLENT

solution dyed acrylic 100% solution dyed acrylic 60” width

Dove White Persian Taupe Honey Wheat Sesame Beige Walnut Brown,
DL-681 DL-061 DL-086 DL-068 DL-079

Autumn Brick Toffee Tweed Charcoal Tweed Expresso Brown Banana Yellow
DL-074 DL-113 DL-494 DL-005 DL-916

Passion Red Logo Red New Pomegranate Red Red Wine Crimson Red Tweed
DL-040 DL-683 DL-035 DL-060 DL-109

Purple Tweed Ruby Red Tweed Pacific Blue New Captain Blue Roval Biue
DL-490 DL-678 DL-682 DL-007 DL-077

Dark Blue Captain Blue Tweed Forest Green Emerald Green Tweed Manhattan Mist Grey
DL-084 DL-679 DL-072 DL-111 DL-041

Stone Grey Goose Grey Tweed Jet Black
DL-087 DL-677 DL-680




[

L
{1111

P!

( A) East Elevation_
\\A/ Scale: 1/8" = 1-0"

237"

A East Elevation
Scale: 1/2" = 1-0"

HANSA COFFEE ROASTERS

Aluminium tubular frame with
canvas cover

Picture Window Area
o 55" x4-11" = 26.63 s.f.

(Max. coverage 15% =3.99 s.f.)
Graphic Area =356 s.f. = 13.36%

"~ ™\_South Elevation
(\\E’/) Scale: 1/8" = 1-0"

Awning Color:
Goose Grey Tweed DL-677

10-10"

/"/;\ South Elevation
‘\\// Scale: 12" = 1'-0"

The
Village Market
Building

600 Walnut Avenue Lake BIuff, IL

General Notes

1. Issued for ABR Review 1/11/16

ACRECHHAYT BN C TS

847.234.4688 WWW.LEFFECT.COM

Building Elevation
& Details

ASK-21

© 2015 COMRGHT LAKE FFECT ASCHITECTS, I




VILLAGE OF LAKE BLUFF

Memorandum

TO: Chairman Hunter and Members of the Architectural Board of Review
FROM: Mike Croak, Building Codes Supervisor

DATE: February 2,2016

SUBJECT: Agenda Item #5--A Continuation of a Public Hearing to Consider a Site Plan to Review
Changes to the Lake Bluff Middle School at 31 E Sheridan Place

On December 1, 2015, the Architectural Board of Review held a public hearing to consider the proposed addition
to Lake Bluff Middle School. At the conclusion of the public hearing, the ABR recommended approval of the
addition with the following items to return for final approval:

1. Front Entry — Revised design is attached.
2. Mechanical Units -- Units will be in locations shown in plans reviewed on 12/1.
3. Noise — Applicants will submit noise consultant’s report to staff when it is complete to verify that
noise complies with the terms of the Special Use Permit.
4. Landscaping — Landscape plan is attached and is discussed in the cover letter.
5 Signage — No new signage is proposed. The School will leave the existing sign in place.
Recommendation:

It is recommended the ABR conduct a public hearing to consider modification to the site plan and signage plan,
appropriately question the Petitioner as needed, entertain public comments and questions from the petitioner
and make one of the following recommendations regarding the site plan:

e Recommend that the Village Board approve the proposed site plan as presented or with conditions;
e Recommend that the Village Board deny the proposed site plan; or
e Request the petitioner to provide additional information for the ABR’s consideration.

Craig Siepka, architect, and Village Staff will be in attendance at Tuesday’s meeting to respond to questions from
the ABR. If you should have any questions regarding this matter, please feel free to contact me at 847-283-6885.



Wight
'/ﬂl'lc

- ,f/“u 2500 North Frontage Road
' Darien, IL 60561

.....................

msﬂﬂ ﬂ’mﬁ,m i Jlﬁ :=1; P 630.969.7000
F 630.969.7979

Lake Bluff Elementary School District 65
LAKE BLUFF MIDDLE SCHOOL ADDITIONS AND ALTERATIONS

Exhibit E — Landscaping and Signage Workscope
2/2/16

LANDSCAPING

School District 65 will proceed with the landscaping design plans shown on the previously
submitted Landscaping Plan Sheet L1.00 (herein attached for reference). Included in these
plans/details are tree replacement quantities commensurate with Village regulations and
shrubs and perennials for the planter boxes at the Main Entrance (northwest corner of the
existing building — reference detail ES2/L1.00) and the along the north side of the Fine Arts
Addition (reference ES3/L1.00). Additional requested landscaping items around the
perimeter of the new out-building and classroom addition (details ES1/L1.00 and
ES5/L1.00 respectively) are no longer contemplated for in this project. School District
leadership is committed to reconsidering these landscaping items should funds become
available in the future.

SIGNAGE
At this time the School District is not planning to add additional signage to the facility. The
existing school sign along Sheridan Place will remain in its current location.



recording or otherwise, without the prior written consent of Wight.

Jan 19, 2016 2:54:45 pm
photocopying,

S:\Darien\Lake Bluff SD_65\01-5079—05_Lake Bluff MS Additions—Alterations\DWG\CD\L1.00 LANDSCAPE PLAN.dwg slaffin
Wight © Copyright 2016 All rights reserved. No part of these documents may be reproduced, stored, or transmitted in any form or by any means, electronic, mechanical,

: LAKE BLUFF SCHOOLS
, DISTRICT 65

vvvvvvvvvvv

TR, 1R & LAKE BLUFF ELEMENTARY
INFILTRATION TRENCH .~~~ .FLAGSTONE SPLASH PAD A */ ~ § SCHOOL DISTRICT 65

SEE CIVIL DETAILS + «  SEE LANDSCAPE DETAILS -

ES1 \| ENLARGED LANDSCAPE PLAN 1

‘ - SCALE: 1'=20’
INFILTRATION TRENCH - L1.00
[ SEE CIVIL DETAILS ®
,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,, y

| w
ETaTaAYATAYaAvAwaAWAWAWAWEWAAWAWAWA WA W AW - . N
m — @_\ B
| \\
. X Wight & Company
@_ G wightco.com
] O | e S PR
- 2500 North Frontage Road
Iea 4 Darien, IL 60561
| e e e ~~1 P 630.969.7000
XX 9 F 630.969.7979
— X A% 4
A @ ENLARGED LANDSCAPE PLAN 2
.".,' 4 RESTORE DISTURBED AREA |_1 O SCALE: 1’=1o’
C W/ BLUEGRASS SOD :
2 = S
RO
W I ammm—
- ’ v ) v ’ KENTUCKY BLUEGRASS SOD
| = TTTTTITIT PLL . //
@ ENLARGED LANDSCAPE PLAN 3
L 1.00/ SCALE: 1'=20'
N

ES1
1.00

L1.00/ SCALE: 1’=10 DESCRIPTION DATE

LAKE BLUFF
MIDDLE SCHOOL

PLANT SCHEDULE

1 G

Qry KEY Botanical Name
SHADE TREES
1[TIAM Tilia americana American Linden 3" caliper B&B as shown
1|GIBI Ginkgo biloba Ginkgo (male) 3" caliper B&B as shown
ORNAMENTAL/ EVERGREEN TREES N
2|ACGR Acer griseum Paperbark Maple 2" cal. B&B as shown
17]JUSK Juniperus scopulorum 'Skyrocket Skyrocket Juniper #7 B&B as shown

SHRUBS

< 4'- : -<7 _ i - - | RESTORE DISTURBED AREA 17|BUGR Buxus x 'Green Mountain' Green Mountain Boxwood #7 cont. as shown
| 4 4 a - < W/ BLUEGRASS SOD 6[JUSG Juniperus x pfitzeriana 'Sea Green' Sea Green Juniper #7 cont. as shown 31 E SHERIDAN PLACE

= h . \
L] e « W v 6|RHAR Rhus aromatica 'Gro-Low!' Gro-Low Fragrant Sumac #7 cont. as shown LAKE BLUFF IL 60044
’ “ ©, v v v 1Q|RIAL Ribes alpinum Alpine Currant #7 cont. as shown ’
- g. v

\ -
¢ : AR -
< g w .f 4 w 10|SYPA Syringa meyeri 'Palibin Dwarf Korean Lilac #7 cont. as shown

“ \ . ‘ ’ W PERENNIALS Wigh'l'
W v 0‘ n v v 15|ACOG Acorus gramineus 'Ogon' Golden Variegated Sweet Flag #1 cont. 18" o.c.

M'e®. W vV~ 10|FEEL Festuca glauca 'Elijah Blue' Elijah Blue Fescue #1 cont. as shown

v & v 2\ Halconech! Al Gold'
X n macr "

(12) G| FLAGSTONE SPLASH PAD B Ws§/ soles [Hemerocals x Sl geore Seis s ore bayly " ot Tisres LANDSCAPE PLAN
\GAAL) © ) @| [ SEE LANDSCAPE DETALS v iy : <

0

N OT ES . 93|PASH Panicum virgatum 'Shenandoah’ Shenandoah Switchgrass #1 cont. 18" o.c.
n

ANY DAMAGE TO THE RIGHT—OF—WAY DURING DEMOLITION SHALL BE RESTORED TO EXISTING CONDITIONS.
2. ALL DIMENSIONS ARE TO THE BACK OF CURB/EDGE OF PAVEMENT UNLESS OTHERWISE SHOWN. ALL RADII DIMENSIONS ARE TO
THE BACK OF CURB/EDGE OF PAVEMENT.

—

3. CONTRACTOR TO PROTECT ALL EXISTING UTILITIES DURING DEMOLITION AND CONSTRUCTION ACTIVITIES UNLESS OTHERWISE GRAPHIC SCALE Project Number:
SPECIFIED. 0l-5079-05
4. ALL EXISTING TREES TO REMAIN AND TO BE PROTECTED UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED. 30 0 15 30 60
5. ANY UTILITY ADJUSTMENTS, CONFLICTS, RELOCATIONS, ETC. REQUIRED SHALL BE COORDINATED WITH ENGINEER AND UTILITY g — Drown By:
OWNER /PROVIDER. 5L
6. ALL REMOVAL OF CONCRETE SHALL BE DONE TO THE NEAREST JOINT. T INCH = 30 FEET Sheet:
@ ENLARGED LANDSCAPE PLAN 4 7. ANY DAMAGE TO THE LANDSCAPE AREAS SHALL BE RESTORED TO EXISTING CONDITIONS. )

W SCALE: 1'=16’ L1 oo
NOT FOR CONSTRUCTION 0




O
m_ —
v = E——
ot z S w =
o N N —
o _m O oS o 1 m W
- Z . O
. _..G.._ | m ”m O ﬁlv S
| S e R 7 . 9 LL O O U= - ‘
L= = O = 2 So | =z -
| =) E ‘S5-oo - = S — ==
S | u £ --Efwv-SK _ P O ME ——
. G| = = s E-=2g-~RR = s < Z —
Az 28 S 2:52:88 - o] o W S= | o
o 20 Tgzelaa v o —J == | Z2Z 3
8w $5:85:88 - ol WA w3 < 58
) Ll = C c =
M. = 2zl < = U |5 S g g
= o O = "3 1== £ g2 s
J-
Z
o
-
) 1 W
\ N €-.8¢ —m
© -
va , i i i I , , = 2
| | | | " | | | R N
i - | | | | , | | | @) 0
IR T T A O A z O
JLP b =
— ﬂ_v | | | | ! | | |
1 KON I A R T " Q
| | | | | [ee}
e | EEREEEE .z 5
- - ] < Z
PN N s N N O O O O R | H
z g "
! L o N O
HEN "
Z |2
o \ A i
— o5 X S
[ ). iy ® 0 9, — «
““““““““““ .S -.GT T 0-g Otlon LTT-8 0-2 W0-% 0-.T-.T-I .£-.8 .0-.0T 8-.0 = L
s SA ] | 1 ~ 5 <
“““““““““ g . Ll 3
\\\\\\\\\\\\\\ : N
| N -
e | | = & .
| I |V Eo—— u < A o ~N
- = = 8L
= —
0 L
! >
< w o
Li 1
Y 5 S0 z o
= L K <
™ 8-.v S o = S
= % [=a \
i |
= N :O |N
b P :
¥ -.G¢ d /-.0T
JIT-.G€ m
—
L
V -
w o
— 1
Zz o
AMn 1
|4 .
= i i I S
L I
i
I
A A A
LA
N N N ™
A |
| /]
N Al I
| |
! - |
mw WJ7IEO -,
D ,, 3
N N
N N N ~
\..,o\,.,_o m
ﬂ?%,_
N N
N N
b ' Z
Z O
O —
= S
> Y LL]
N N -
, L] Q —
| —I LLI
5 — —
,, ) nd
s _.W._ Iiitsath et nNu
- . I§ ' A .
g — % e m._U
o Z 5 ihhhhhhhhih Z 5
< - HHHHIHHHEHH <
IR X ARARApERERRRRRA RN RRRRE 0¥ =
t =" = =
N T e e e R i sk L
= Z |2 ity Z 2
| L3 R Wi s
—~s 1 1l HHHHHHHHEHHH
(=) ()

1ybim 4O JuSSU0D UM Joldd Syl yInoylm ‘esimiaylo Jo buipiodesds ‘buiAdooojoyd ‘pPolubyoswl ‘OlU0JID9|8 ‘supauwl AuD AQ JO WJO) AUD Ul PallllUSuUDJ)} JO ‘padols ‘paonpodded o9 Apw sjuswnoop asay) jo yod oN paAdesad syybu ||y 9107 1ybAdon @ 1ubim

Wo 420l 910Z ‘6l uor

opnoibo bmpruepiog goXt,Z—G0—6/0G—10ASY HDIS |DUIY vYEaZ0d 9L10—9102\Selld 40d\dS—I\Sbuimpig— I\ suonoie}|y —suonippy S Hnig 8407 G0—6/,0G—20\G9  dS HNig o\ uspQ\ S



T
H -]
_—
...l.l_
p—
=)
==
[
1
—
i
1
: _
fe——H}
T

DISTRICT 65

LAKE BLUFF SCHOOLS

O
O
Q
2 S S
[~ 4 = =
Mﬁ ] S ] m
55 h : 3
w .8 O e
=> e - LL wy
. L
w5 . % o & sh 3 Nv -
o= g £ O So | =z
er g2 Swv.8 US = Q
g ommm :: f3:8% =zl O z35 | &
D 0 OC8-£3 aa s -l m Wl <= | = .
— B o9 =-99 [ [ Th o
O . O\ O L — N Q
B tKoNnooo RDH RF
T £f.098.29%2 o 260 W i) w v En
Ll 29.23%5.053 4 O T = Z 29 o
< U =22 .88 2L < o KD » o Z T oo
<“ © < —= wy |22 8x ¢ =
=zl 3= =3 |2 8 g ¢
e

NOT FOR CONSTRUCTION

VA0
\

IR

N\

UbIM 4O JusSUOD UB1IlUM Joildd Byl ynoylm ‘o buipiooas ‘buikdooojoyd ‘|polUDYOBW ‘OlUOUIDS|E ‘supaw AUD AQ JO WJO) AUD Ul Pal}lluUsSuDJ} JO ‘paJols ‘paonpouded 29 Apw sjuswinoop asayl jo yiod oN ‘paadesal siybu Iy 9102 14ybuAdon @ 1ybim

Wwo 9G:40:LlL 9l0Z ‘6L udp 8pnolbo Bmpiiepiog goxyZz—G0—6/0G—L0ASY HDIS [DU4 VEZ0d 9110—9102\sall4 40d\dS—1L\sSbumpig™ 3\ suonpia}|y —suoippY SN HNig 8407 G0—6/0G—20\G9 dS #Nig &pT\uslng\ S

SIMJSYy10 JO



VILLAGE OF LAKE BLUFF

Memorandum

TO: Chairman Hunter and Members of the Architectural Board of Review
FROM: Mike Croak, Building Codes Supervisor

DATE: February 2,2016

SUBJECT: Agenda Item #6--A Public Hearing to Consider a Site Plan to Review Changes to Light
Fixtures for the Paddle Courts at Blair Park at 355 W Washington Avenue

The Lake Bluff Park District is proposing to replace the existing pole-mounted light fixtures for the paddle courts
at Blair Park with new LED fixtures. As described in the attached letter, the Park District has received complaints
from Paddle Court users regarding the low light levels on the courts. In order to improve lighting on the courts,
while keeping the off-court light level low, they have selected the proposed GX60-4R LED fixture. The Park
District installed the LED fixtures on the northern paddle court on a temporary trail basis a few months ago. The
attached light survey was done with the new fixtures on the northern court and the old fixtures on the other 2
courts. It shows brighter light levels on the northern court, with lower light levels 20° away from that court, using
the new fixtures. The lights on the tennis courts will not change.

Recommendation:

It is recommended the ABR conduct a public hearing to consider modification to the site plan, appropriately
question the Petitioner as needed, entertain public comments and questions and make one of the following
recommendations regarding the site plan:

e Recommend that the Village Board approve the proposed site plan as presented or with conditions;
e Recommend that the Village Board deny the proposed site plan; or
* Request the petitioner to provide additional information for the ABR’s consideration.

Ed Heiser, Superintendent of Facility Services for the Park District, and Village Staff will be in attendance at
Tuesday’s meeting to respond to questions from the ABR. If you should have any questions regarding this matter,
please feel free to contact me at 847-283-6885.



LAKE BLUFF PARK DISTRICT

355 W. WASHINGTON AVENUE * LAKE BLUFF, ILLINOIS 60044  Phone (847) 234-4150

P <
ARk pISTR

January 21, 2016

Architectural Board of Review
Village of Lake Bluff

40 East Center Avenue

Lake Bluff, IL 60044

To Whom It May Concern:

On June 9, 2008, the Lake Bluff Board of Trustees passed Ordinance 2008-14, an ordinance
amending Ordinance 99-27 and Ordinance 2004-09, to permit the construction, operation and
maintenance of a paddle tennis facility at Blair Park. This ordinance outlined several
conditions applicable to the installation and utilization of lights for evening play.

In the ordinance the Park District agrees “to take all reasonable and appropriate measures to
reduce the impact of the outdoor lighting for the Paddle Tennis Facility on neighboring
properties.” In addition, the Park District must ensure “all light fixtures associated with the
Paddle Tennis Facility will be full cut-off light fixtures that maintain and preserve a dark-at-
night environment.”

In 2014, Park District staff began receiving comments from paddle members regarding poor
light levels on-court during evening play. While not meeting standards established by other
clubs in the area, light levels on-court during play were dangerously low. Staff has utilized
the past year to investigate a lighting solution that improves these conditions while reducing
electrical consumption and not adversely impact neighboring properties.

During this investigation, staff identified LED Industries’ GX60-4R Retrofit Recessed LED
fixtures as a potential solution. Park District staff worked with Village staff to install these
fixtures for a trial period on one court at the Paddle Club beginning in late August. During
the trial period, staff evaluated light levels on-court and off, sent correspondences to
neighboring residents encouraging feedback and surveyed current members. The results of
this investigation found that these LED fixtures accomplished all three goals established
within this project.

The GX60-4R Retrofit Recessed LED fixtures are a full cut-off fixture that will reduce light
pollution from the Paddle Club. As shown in the photometric plan attached, light levels
twenty feet off the court are less by Court #1, where the LED fixtures are currently installed,
when compared to Courts #2 and #3 where the original fixtures remain. In addition, the Park



District planted and has maintained landscaping between the paddle tennis facility and
neighboring properties to additional reduce the impact of the facility’s lighting.

The Lake Bluff Park District respectfully requests approval to amend the lighting fixture in
Exhibit B of Ordinance 2008-14 from the Challenger I Medium to the GX60-4R Retrofit
Recessed. The Park District is looking to replace the six existing fixtures on each of the three
courts with the new LED fixture. No additional fixtures will be installed. The Park District
appreciates your consideration of this request.

Sincere

Ed Heiser
Superintendent of Facility Services
Lake Bluff Park District

cc: Drew Irvin, Lake Bluff Village Manger
Ron Salski, Executive Director



APPLICATION FOR ARCHITECTURAL REVIEW
VILLAGE OF LAKE BLUFF, ILLINOIS
SITE PLAN APPROVAL

Applicant: (AKE, Buupe Pace. DISTRICT

Mailing Address: 3ss L0 LOASHI Y TON  Ave

Location of project: 353 1O LOASHIOC T Al

Telephone: &4 - 234 - 410

E-Mail Address: ¢ Heise e LAY ERLUSFPARKDISTIZIC Y. OEX,

Contact Individual for Project: ¢ Hejse@  SUPERIOTEON T

APPLICATION REQUIREMENTS

Any applicant seeking site plan approval shall submit to the Village
Administrator, or his or her designee, 13 copies of each of the following
documents listed below plus a non-refundable application fee of $300.00 (see
current fee schedule) plus an amount determined by the Village Administrator
to reimburse the Village for all anticipated out of pocket expenses incurred in
connection with the delivery of notice pursuant to this section.

o A survey showing existing conditions including buildings, structures,
trees over four inches in trunk diameter, streets, utility easements,
rights-of-way, land use, and other data required by the Lake Bluff
Subdivision Ordinance.

o A site plan showing proposed building locations and land use areas,
sidewalks, pedestrian walks, parking lot and walkway lighting, signage,
and site plan amenities. The location of garbage and refuse collection
points, mail pick-up points, and loading areas shall also be specified.

o A vehicle and traffic parking plan for access location, access
geometric, onsite traffic circulation and parking areas.

o Preliminary drawings for buildings to be constructed, including floor
plans, exterior elevations and sections, building materials, and a color,
three dimensional rendering thereof.

o Preliminary engineering plans and engineering feasibility studies
including: lighting: street improvements; drainage system; sewer
system; and Public utility extensions. All requirements of the Lake Bluff
Subdivision Ordinance must be fully complied with, including but not
limited to construction of underground electrical and telephone service.




INDUSTRIES

GX60-4R Retrofit Kit Recessed

Specifications

Total Lumens:
Total Wattage:
Lumens/watt:
CCT:

CRI:

Life Expectancy:

@ &

200,000+ hours LED's
60,000 hours-drivers

Features and Benefits

o Reduction of energy costs by up to 80%

¢ Built with high quality Cree, Nichia, and
Samsung LED chips.

¢ Patented technology that dissipates heat
outside of the fixture — patent #8807783

e Easy to install and no service required
for 5 years

e 10 year Limited Warranty, 5 years on driver
¢ Compatible with all existing light controls

¢ Retrofit kits available for all exterior and high
bay fixtures

e Input voltage options from 100-480V

e Built in surge protection

e Replaces 600-1000W HID and Halogen lamps
e P65, IP66, IP67 rated

¢ 5 optic options

e Available in black, grey, white, and bronze

e Available colors: 2700K, 3000K, 3500K,
4000K, and 5000K

¢ Typical applications: Auto dealerships,
large parking lots

3001 N US Highway 12, Spring Grove, IL 60081 | 888-700-7815 | www.TheGreenerLED.com 11172016



"S3[PUBD 100] UT pamseawr JySr

Tl

gl

€T

80 Tl $1 8'1 T 97 97 1'z L1
[y]
(=]
L6 8Tl '8 S’L L9 6 0t
765 0°6€ €69 5%l psl Tl 6'€l 6°€l LSl
o Tt 9'9¢ 691 vLI I'sI 2L 091 981
¥ 08 8Ll 9'0Z
$'b9 869 vZl P El LTI o€l 09
0T g6 ISy TLI 681 891 g'SI 6Ll TLI
S'TY TEE 965 €€l S'Ll 9°Z1 8¢l ¢Sl 611
6L 86 6L '8 79 €L 0t
[# 1mo) T# 10D £4# 1Mo) _
0T _
€T 'z
N LNH
97Aavd

SHANIXIH LNADSIANVONI €4 ® TH LN 0D |
STOT ‘ST YAIWIDAA A0 SV AHAYNS LHOI'T

SHANIXM YVINAON @T :1# L3401 0D

aNTOATAAVd AN TADIV]



GX60-4R Retrofit Recessed Fixture Challenger II Medium Fixture

Left: GX60-4R Retrofit Recessed Fixture Right: Challenger IT Medium Fixture



4
-

s

View of Paddle Club from Northeast



LAKE BLUFF PARK DISTRICT

355 W. WASHINGTON AVENUE * LAKE BLUFF, ILLINOIS 60044  Phone (847) 234-4150

Py <
ARk DisTRC

August 12, 2015

Warren Crews
335 W Washington Ave
Lake Bluff, IL 60044

Mr. Crews,

Recently, the Park District has received feedback regarding the current lights used on the
courts at the Paddle Club. Staff is currently investigating several options to improve lighting
conditions on court while reducing electrical consumptions and reducing light pollution to
our Blair Park neighbors. While this project is currently not funded, the Park District would
like to complete a pilot program that will include installing LED lights into the current
fixtures at one of the courts of the Paddle Club.

This pilot program will last thirty days and will begin Wednesday, August 19. During this
program, staff will be conducting a lighting assessment and receiving feedback from Paddle
Club members and residents. Following the pilot program, the lights on the one court used
will be restored to the original specifications.

I would like to meet with each resident in-person anytime during the next week to address
any questions or concerns you may have. Please feel free to contact me by e-mail or phone
to schedule a time where I can either visit with you at your home or at the Park District.

Sincerely,

Ed Heiser

Superintendent of Facility Services
Lake Bluff Park District
eheiser@lakebluffparkdistrict.org
847-770-8350



LAKE BLUFF PARK DISTRICT

355 W. WASHINGTON AVENUE * LAKE BLUFF, ILLINOIS 60044  Phone (847) 234-4150

-, <
ARk pISTRC

December 31, 2015

Warren Crews
335 W Washington Ave
Lake Bluft, IL. 60044

Dear Mr. Crews,

The Park District has completed a pilot program that included installing modular LED lights
on a court at the Paddle Club. The modular LED lights were installed on the northern most
court in September and have remained installed to current date. During this period, staff has
evaluated the pilot program. The program has improved lighting conditions on the court
while reducing electrical consumption and light pollution to our Blair Park neighbors.

Staff will be presenting the results of this program to the Park Board of Commissioner on
January 4, 2016 at 6:30 p.m. at the Recreation Center. While the Board will not be
authorizing any funding for this project until the Regular Board Meeting on January 25,
2016, your feedback during this process is welcome.

I encourage you to attend either of the upcoming meetings or contact Ron Salski or myself
directly with any questions or concerns you may have.

Sincerely,

Ed Heiser

Superintendent of Facility Services
Lake Bluff Park District
cheiser@lakebluffparkdistrict.org
847-457-7342

cc: Drew Irvin, Lake Bluff Village Manger
Ron Salski, Executive Director



VILLAGE OF LAKE BLUFF

Memorandum

TO: Chairman Hunter and Members of the Architectural Board of Review
FROM: Mike Croak, Building Codes Supervisor

DATE: February 2, 2016

SUBJECT: Agenda Item #7--Consideration of a Sign Permit for Dold for Congress Office at 999
Sherwood Drive

Dold for Congress is opening an office in the 999 Sherwood Drive building formerly occupied by Joie de Velo.
They are proposing to install new sign faces in the existing ground sign cabinet and lettering on the glass door.
The background of the ground sign will be non-illuminated in order to comply with code and the largest lettering
on the door sign will be 5 or less.

The following is a chart summarizing the measurements of the proposed signs:

1.) Two ground signs permitted on a corner lot Complies—One sign proposed

2.) Maximum Ground Sign Size is 64 square feet Complies—24 square feet

3.) One door sign permitted Complies

4.) Lettering on Door Sign Cannot Exceed 5 Tall Complies
Recommendation:

It is recommended the ABR conduct a public meeting to consider the signage plan, appropriately question the
Petitioner as needed, entertain public comments and questions and make one of the following recommendations
regarding the signage:

=  Approve the sign permit; or
=  Deny the sign permit.

Ken Fogel of North Shore Sign and Village Staff will be in attendance at Tuesday’s meeting to respond to
questions from the ABR. If you should have any questions regarding this matter, please feel free to contact me at
847-283-6885.



FOR CONGRESS

REFACE EXISTING D/FACE ILLUMINATED DISPLAY

1/2' = 1-0" APPLIED WINDOW VINYL
1/2" = 10"

FLAT PLEXIGLAS FACE / OPAQUE WHITE BKG. / BLUE (230-36) VINYL APPLIED COPY WHITE APPLIED VINYL COPY / RED STAR

& RED (230-33) STAR APPLIED TO 1ST SURFACE OF WINDOW

Colors depicted on this drawing are printed simulations to assist in visualizing the design.
| 1 They do not accurately reflect the actual colors specified.

=]

This design is the exclusive property of North Shore Sign Company Inc., and is the result of the original
and creative work of its employees. This drawing is submitted to the respective customer for the sole
purpose of consideration of whether or not to purchase this design, or a sign manufactured to this design
from North Shore Sign Co. Distribution, use of, or exhibition of this drawing to anyone outside
customers organization, in order to secure quotation, design work, or purchase of a sign either to this

design or similar to this design, is expressly forbidden. In the event that such distribution, use or

1925 Industrial Drive Libertyville, lllinois 60048 847-816-7020
exhibition occurs, North Shore Sign is to be compensated $1500.00 for time, effort and creative service

"Quality Signage Since1930" entailed in creating these plans, as well as any and all legal fees and expenses to enforce its rights.
Copyright 2014 North Shore Sign Company Inc.

DOLD FOR CONGRESS
999 SHERWOOD DR. LAKE BLUFF, IL.

SCALE  NQTED

DATE  19/22/15

DRAW BY:

AS

SALESPERSON

KEN

DRAWING #

10748




VILLAGE OF LAKE BLUFF

Memorandum

TO: Chairman Hunter and Members of the Architectural Board of Review
FROM: Mike Croak, Building Codes Supervisor

DATE: February 2, 2016

SUBJECT: Agenda Item #8—A Conceptual Discussion of Potential Streetscape Improvements to the
Southeast Corner of Scranton Avenue and Center Avenue

The Village has noticed that the wall enclosing the flower bed on the southeast corner of Scranton and Center in
front of Inovasi is in need of maintenance or repair. As some members of the ABR may recall, a new design for
this corner was approved in 2007, but some aspects of the new design have not yet been implemented. The
crosswalk across Center Avenue was moved farther north in 2007 with the expectation that the new planter bed
would be installed to align with it. Because of cost-cutting in the recession, this didn’t happen. As a result, the
cross walk runs toward the side of the old planter bed and pedestrians have to turn to go around it.

The Village is now looking to implement more of the 2007 design, possibly in a slightly altered version to use
more durable materials and control costs.

The Village is also interested in installing a bike rack near the parking in front of Village Hall.
Jake Terlap, Public Works Superintendent, will be in attendance for a conceptual discussion of this item.

Recommendation:
Provide feedback to staff regarding the possibility of revising and then implementing the streetscape design.




—
=5 1L 56
—
; Bike R
— |
a
I g
§ g.
5|
|8
[ &
i‘"?r .’: e i
Sy, 7 L |
a | I I | I N S
TIIITI T I T ITITTITT QL
I f\ll

S ey e b RTINS

Lake Bluff Urban Design Plan

Villoge Green

HMpAdEEORE [l B HE

~H |

ik £ Nt

T ——. | 'f N

proposed tree roadway bluestone brick walk ceoncrete  proposed proposed liahting
walkway shrube plant mn .

i

Land Design Collaborative, Inc. September 2007




HMB36 Endless Sin‘ﬁmer
Big Leaf Hydrangea

VCC36 Fra:g-r:imt Viburnum

ICG36 Ckom.p

NCS Achillea Summer

k]

Bt

i

act Inkberry

J‘

VMD Drats Bl

ue Periwinkle

\ ’; \ \
Corner Landscape- East Center at Scranton Intersection
( gl o Josnse (it [ il i TR

transfo

—found lron plpe—

Land Design' Colllaboratii

Lake Bluff Urban Design Plan




VILLAGE OF LAKE BLUFF

Memorandum

TO: Chairman Hunter and Members of the Architectural Board of Review
FROM: Mike Croak, Building Codes Supervisor

DATE: February 2, 2016

SUBJECT: Agenda Item # 9 -- A Discussion of Potential Building Code Updates

Lake BIluff Village policy is to consider the adoption of the latest building codes every three to four years in order to
stay current with the latest technology and best practices in the industry. Accordingly, staff has prepared the attached
recommended changes to Village Ordinances to adopt the new codes. As was true in previous years, the model
codes under consideration are published by the International Code Council (ICC) and the National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA), or, in the case of the Plumbing Code and the Accessibility Code, by the State of Illinois.

Below is a list of the model codes currently adopted and proposed.

Currently Adopted Code Proposed Code

2012 International Building Code 2015 International Building Code

2012 International Residential Code 2015 International Residential Code

2012 International Property Maintenance Code 2015 International Property Maintenance Code
2012 International Fire Code 2015 International Fire Code

2004 1llinois Plumbing Code 2014 1llinois Plumbing Code

2011 National Electrical Code 2014 National Electrical Code

2012 International Fuel Gas Code 2015 International Fuel Gas Code

1997 Illinois Accessibility Code 1997 Illinois Accessibility Code

2012 International Energy Conservation Code 2015 International Energy Conservation Code
2012 International Mechanical Code 2015 International Mechanical Code

2012 International Swimming Pool & Spa Code 2015 International Swimming Pool & Spa Code
2012 International Existing Building Code 2015 International Existing Building Code

The following is a summary of significant points for the ABR’s consideration.

Staff recommends one change to Title 9 (Building Regulations), Chapter 1(Administration and Enforcement) of the
Lake Bluff Code:
Permit Renewals: Currently, Section 9-1-9 of the Lake Bluff Municipal Code provides that permits expire one
year after issuance (unless a longer time is specified on the face of the permit) and that, if an extension is needed,
the applicant must pay an additional 50% of the original permit fee for a six month extension. Because the
amount of the renewal fee has been unduly burdensome for larger projects, this provision has not been
consistently enforced in the past. The Village’s goal is to incentivize prompt completion without unduly
burdening larger projects that may need more time. Accordingly, staff’s recommendation is the following:
1. Keep existing 12 month expiration date for permit for project of a construction cost of
$300,000 or less.

2. Establish new 15 month expiration date for projects of more than $300,000 construction
cost

3. For renewals, charge $200 per month if exterior work is incomplete, but only $100 per
month if exterior work is complete and only interior is incomplete.

4. Require a deposit to cover 6 months of permit renewals, before a Temporary Certificate

of Occupancy is issued, unless the TCO is being issued more than 2 months before the
expiration date and, in the opinion of the Code Official, it is reasonably likely that the
work will be completed before the permit expiration date.



5. If permit expires and is not renewed while work is incomplete, then any bond (deposit) is
forfeited.

6. Expiration date is based on the date the permit is issued or the date that work starts
whichever is earlier.

International Building Code

Staff recommends adoption of the 2015 edition of International Building Code (IBC) with the same
amendments that we had for 2012 edition, except for one change. An amendment that Lake Bluff adopted in 2010
requiring that fire rated partitions within a building be constructed of masonry has not proven to be practical. Staff
recommends that we eliminate this amendment and allow fire rated partitions to be constructed of any materials
allowed by the 2015 IBC. One reason why requiring masonry fire partitions has proven to be impractical is that the
code requires a fire rated partition between restaurants and retail spaces; however, in multi-tenant buildings, tenant
spaces change so frequently that it not practical to erect a masonry wall between every restaurant and every retail
space. A variance to this amendment was granted to one of the Target outlots so that the wall between Meatheads
and GNC did not have to be masonry. This amendment is only regarding fire partitions (which are within one
building) and not fire walls (which separate different buildings).

Attached is a summary prepared by four trade associations that summarizes significant changes to the 2015
IBC and the other I-codes (codes published by the International Code Council). The overview on page 2 notes that
there are several beneficial changes that make the 2015 IBC more user friendly.

International Energy Conservation Code

lllinois State law mandates that constructions projects for which permits are submitted on or after January 1,
2016 comply with the 2015 edition of the International Energy Conservation Code. Attached is a summary of 12
changes to the residential provisions of the new energy code and 11 changes to the commercial provisions.

Illinois Plumbing Code

1. Attached is letter from the Illinois Department of Natural Resources informing us that all communities
that use Lake Michigan water are required by State law to establish plumbing code amendments
requiring new plumbing fixtures to be Water Sense labeled for water conservation.

2. The IDNR Ietter also informs us that we are required to prohibit the irrigation of lawns during a six hour
time period in the middle of the day. Currently, Section 8-1D-4 of the Lake Bluff Code prohibits
watering for a five hour time period from 12:01 PM to 5:00 PM. Staff recommends amending the time
t0 11:00 AM to 5:00 PM.

3. Lake Bluff’s municipal code refers to the 2004 edition of the Illinois Plumbing Code. Since the State
has published a 2014 edition to the Illinois Plumbing Code, we will amend the municipal code to refer
to the latest edition.

4. One of the more controversial changes to the Illinois Plumbing Code is that it now allows polyethylene
tubing (PEX) for water supply piping. Staff recommends that we maintain our existing plumbing
material restrictions, which are similar to those of neighboring communities, and which require copper
pipe for water supply.

Illinois Radon Resistant Construction Act

State law has required new residential construction to provide a radon mitigation system (passive or active
venting) since June 1, 2013. By adopting these requirements into the Lake Bluff Code, the Village will have the
authority to enforce these requirements.

National Electrical Code
Attached is a summary of 12 significant changes within the latest edition of the National Electrical Code.

Building Code Update Process: Following the discussion at the January 5 meeting, staff has written a complete set
of redlined proposed amendments to Chapter 9 of the Lake Bluff Municipal Code. The complete redline draft is
available on the Village’s website under this meeting’s ABR packet. The Code requires the ABR to hold public
hearing on the matter and then make a recommendation to the Village Board.

If you should have any questions regarding this matter, please feel free to contact me at 847-283-6885.


http://www.lakebluff.org/village-news/11-village-news/803-upcoming-building-code-revisions-meeting-02-02

Attachments:
1. 2015 ICC Model Codes Summary of Important Changes
2. Significant Changes to the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code
3. General Summary of the Changes to the Illinois Plumbing Code
4. IDNR letter
5. Changes to the 2014 National Electrical Code



RTTTERYEON

Attachment 1

NATHIONAL
MULTIFAMILY
HOUSING
COUNCIL

NATONAL

APARTMENT N A
ASSOCIATION

BACKGROUNDER | OCTOBER zo014

The 2015 International Code Council (ICC) model building codes were complet-
ed in June 2014 and are now available for <§d@§}fi§m at the state and local level.
‘This document summarizes the significant changes made between the 2012 and
2013 codes that affect apartments (Residential R-2) and commercial occupancies
For the first time, the National Multifamily Housing Council (NMHC), kd??«}?%g
Apartment Association (NAA), Bu ;;%f%z%z,g., Owners and Managers Association
(BOMA) and National Association of Home Builders (NAHB) encourage state
and local jurisdictions to consider adopting the 2015 I-Codes when updating their
state or g{)i,gié codes. Two exceptions to this are noted in this document,

Importanily, this summary does not include all the changes, and therefore devel-
opers and designers need fo consult the codes for other changes that may impact a
“*??i;;‘*a,% ic design. For each change, the tables included indicate whether the change
is likely to result in higher or lower costs (or whether the impact is unknown).

Mattanal Multifamily Housing Councl
5G4 Sirest, MW, Sults 530
Washington, DC 20034

T WA ZBBG Phone | weewnmhnorng

© This d may not be reproduced or itted electronically, in whole or in part, without permission from the National Multifamily Housing Council.




This Backgrounder reviews the key changes between the 2012 and 2015 ICC Codes that affect apartments (Res-
idential R-2) and commercial properties. The good news for designers and developers is that for the first time
ever, NMHC/NAA, BOMA and NAHB encourage state and local jurisdictions to consider adopting the 2015 I-
Codes when updating their state or local codes. There are two exceptions to this, however. The first is the In-
ternational Green Construction Code (IgCC) which has not been published. The second is the International En-
ergy Conservation Code (IECC), which we suggest be amended in some key areas. Those recommendations are
included in a separate document titled Recommended Amendments to the 2015 International Energy Conserva-
tion Code (IECC).

Although the codes can largely be adopted as is, they do contain meaningful changes. Therefore, designers and
developers need to be aware of several changes in the 2015 codes that will impact apartments and commercial
properties. Many of the changes benefit apartment and commercial construction, and taken as a whole these
positive changes more than offset the changes that might increase construction costs.

The most beneficial changes, by far, are the ones dealing with podium/pedestal buildings. Most notably, the
2015 codes remove the restriction limiting the podium/pedestal portion of the building to one story. As a result,
the podium/pedestal portion can go to any height without imposing a limit on the number of stories allowed in
the property. The restrictions on occupancies allowed in the podium/pedestal portion of the building have also
been revised. In the 2015 codes, the only restriction remaining is that this portion of the building cannot contain
a Group H (hazard) type occupancy.

Other beneficial changes include: a rewrite of “Chapter 5, Heights and Area” that makes it more user friendly;
new requirements for donut-type construction that establish provisions for separating the garage from the apart-
ment building; permitted uses of NFPA 13R sprinkler systems; and use of cross-laminated and fire-retardant-
treated lumber.

The ICC codes included in this summary:

o 2015 tntemnational Boilding Uode (1B

o 2015 internations! Five Code (1FCY

o 2015 internasional Exdeting Bluiliding Code (1ER

o ZOi%Ipternational Plymbino Code (IPC)

o 2018 mernational Bnerey Conservation Code (1RCC)

Note: A separate document is available that identifies recommended changes to the IECC during the
local adoption process.

o 015 International Mechanical Code (10O

o 2015 International Fuel Gas Code i

The changes are organized by the cost impact they will have. Changes noted as “Decrease” could have a major
impact on how a structure is built and, in several cases, they clarify unclear or misinterpreted code requirements.
Major cost-saving changes include:

1. Removal of the height restriction on the pedestal/podium portion of buildings.

Removal of the limitation on occupancies permitted in the pedestal/podium portion of the building with
the exception of not permitting Type H occupancies.

Redefine how private garages can be used in multifamily buildings.

Determination of building heights, area and setbacks.

5. Separation of the apartment building from garages in donut type construction.

W

S SUMMARY OF1




I
("

N

6. Application of the NFPA 13R sprinkler system.
7. Design and use of assembly occupancies on building roofs.

Changes noted as “Increase” are important and will impact specific requirements within the building. Major
changes in this category include:

1. Requirements for a secondary sprinkler water supply in Seismic Design Category C, D, E, or F.
2. New requirements for opening protective glazing.

3. Use of limited area sprinkler systems.

4. Requirements for alarm systems in college and university buildings.

The changes noted as having cost implication of “None” or “Unknown” need special attention because they will
impact the building design and could have an impact on specific provisions in the code. Major changes here
include:

Revision to requirements on dampers protecting ceiling membrane.

Use of cross-laminated and fire-resistant lumber.

Location of smoke alarms near kitchens and bathrooms.

Use of smoke detection systems as alternative to providing smoke alarms.
Measurement of exit and exit access configuration.

wmoR W N =

One additional note: Special awareness should be given to any attempts to adopt Appendix L — Fire Fighter Air
Replenishment Systems and Appendix M — High-Rise Retro Active Installation of Automatic Sprinkler Systems.
Appendix items are not part of the code unless they are specifically included during the code adoption process.

Designers and builders need to consult the 2015 ICC codes that are not listed for changes that may be of concern
to specific projects.




Dmportant Changes to the 2015 1BC

Section(s) and Issue(s) Type of Change | Cost Conpment
Implication

IBC 202 Definition of Major Change | Decrease Private garages are no longer limited to a maximum

“Private Garage,” 406.3.1 of 3,000 sq. ft. in a building. Multiple private gar-

“Classification,” 406.3.2 ages, each a maximum of 1,000 sq. ft., each sepa-

“Clear Height” rated by one-hour fire barriers or horizontal assem-
blies are now permitted based on their U occupancy
classification. Also, a minimum of 7° clear height
will be required in private garages.

IBC 202 Definition of “Fire | Major Change | Decrease Revised definition to permit other treatment meth-

Retardant Treated Wood” ods by other than the pressure process. See also IBC
Sections 2303.2.2 and 2303.2.3 for further explana-
tion.

IBC 503 through 506 Build- | Makes Code Decrease 2012 IBC Table 503 was replaced with the 2015

ing Heights and Area Re- More User IBC Tables 504.3, 504.4 and 506.2 with NO chang-

quirements Friendly es in the technical application, making the code
more user-friendly. The maximum allowable height
and number of stories can now be determined di-
rectly from Tables 504.3 and 504.4. The maximum
allowable sprinkler area increase can also now be
determined directly from Table 506.2.

IBC 510.2 “Horizontal Major Change Decrease 2012 IBC Section 510.2(2) that limited the Type IA

Building Separation” (i.e., portion of the podium/pedestal building below the

Podium/Pedestal horizontal separation to a maximum of one story

Structures) above grade plane has been deleted in the 2015 IBC
allowing the podium portion of the building to be of
any height without any restriction on the number of
floors. Also, 2015 IBC Section 510.2(5) permits any
occupancy, except Group H, below the horizontal
separation. (See also the table entry under IBC Sec-
tion 903.3.1.2 for further information on podium
design)

IBC 705.3 Exception #2 New Provision | Decrease Permits a parking garage of Construction Type I or

“Buildings on the Same Lot”

IIA to abut a Group R-2 building with 1%- hour-
protected openings (fire doors) in the abutting exte-
rior wall of the garage and no required opening pro-
tective(s) in the abutting wall of a sprinklered R-2
building. Previous editions of the Code did not
permit any openings in these abutting exterior walls
that are at a “0” fire separation distance apart and
required a fire wall design between such buildings
to be permitted to have openings between the abut-
ting buildings.




o~

&

(1

Important Changes to the 2015 IBC (cont’d)

Section(s} and Issue(s)

Type of Change

Cost
Implication

Compnent

IBC 705.6 “Exterior Wall-
Structural Stability”

Major Change

Decrease

Exterior fire-rated walls that are braced by floor or
roof assemblies that have a lesser fire resistance
rating are now permitted. Previous editions of the
IBC Code required Construction Type III buildings
with two -hour fire-rated exterior walls to have
floors that support the two-hour fire-rated exterior
walls to be upgraded to the two-hour fire rating.
This is a major cost since apartment buildings built
of Construction Type III under the legacy codes
only required one-hour floor and roof assemblies to
support the two-hour fire-rated exterior walls.

IBC 707.5 Exception 2 “Fire
Barriers—Continuity”

New:
Clarification

Decrease

Clarifies that the walls of an interior exit stairway
do not need to extend through the attic space to the
underside of the roof deck if the ceiling of the
stairway terminates with a fire-rated top enclosure
complying with Section 713.12.

IBC 714.4.2 Exception 7
“Membrane Penetration”

Revision

Decrease

This exception was new in the 2012 IBC (Section
714.4.1.2 Exception #7) and allowed for a practical
application of the code in circumstances where
wood-framed walls extend up to and attach directly
to the underside of joist/trusses floor and roof fire-
rated assemblies. It was further modified to permit
the wood framed walls to be sheathed solely with
Type X gypsum wallboard in lieu of being a fire
resistance rated wall assembly.

IBC 717.1.1 “Ducts and Air
Transfer Openings”

New Provision

Decrease

Duct will be allowed to leave a fire-rated shaft en-
closure, transition horizontally, and then enter an-
other fire-rated shaft if the duct penetrations on
each side of the shafts are protected with fire damp-
ers. Note that this is not permitted for clothes dryer
exhaust ducts or any other ducts that the I Codes
require to be continuous and uninterrupted.

IBC 903.2.1.6 “Assembly
Occupancies on Roof”

New Provision

Decrease

Code now addresses how to deal with assembly
occupancies on the roof of a building. When the
occupant load > 100 for Group A-2 (i.e., restaurant),
or > 300 for other Group A (i.e., meeting rooms,
swimming pools) all floors to, and including, level
of exit discharge are required to be sprinklered per
NFPA 13 or NFPA 13R, as applicable. Since all new
Group R occupancies are already required to be
sprinklered, this new requirement is a good clarifi-
cation of the Code for such common assembly oc-
cupancies that are to be located on the roofs of new
apartment projects. Note that there is an exception
to this sprinkler requirement for open parking gar-
ages of Construction Type I or Type II.




Important Chan

ges fo the 2015 IBC (cont’d)

Section(sy and Issue(s)

Type of Change

Cost
Implicasion

Conpent

IBC 903.2.11.3 “Automatic
Sprinkler Systems — Where
Required- Buildings 55’ or
More in Height”

Revision

Decrease

This revision clarified that the 55° is measured from
the lowest level of fire department vehicle access to
the finished floor level of the highest floor with an
occupant load of > 30. Exceptions are provided for
open parking garages and F-2 occupancies.

903.3.1.1.2 Exception
“NFPA 13 Exempt
Bathroom Sprinklers”

New Provision

Decrease

The 2015 IBC references the 2013 NFPA 13. In the
2013 NFPA 13 Section 8.15.8.1 the small bathroom
(< 55 sq. ft.) sprinkler exception was deleted for
apartment dwelling units. Since the NFPA 13
Committee deleted this reasonable, long-standing,
sprinkler exception out of its Code, the NFPA 101
Committee, as well as the ICC Membership, decid-
ed to place it back into the 2015 NFPA 101 and
2015 IBC. The NFPA 13 Committee is in the pro-
cess of attempting to place the bathroom exception
for dwelling units back into its 2015 edition of
NFPA 13.

903.3.1.2 “Installation Re-
quirements NFPA 13R
Sprinkler Systems”

Clarification

Decrease

Section was revised to correlate with the scope of
the 2013 NFPA 13R Standard. This should help
prevent any misapplication of the sprinkler stand-
ards that apply to “...Group R occupancies up to
and including four stories in height in buildings not
exceeding 60 feet in height above grade plane...”.
The new second paragraph in this section clarifies
that the number of stories of Group R occupancies
above a podium or pedestal designed structure (see
Section 510.4) is measured from the fire-rated hori-
zontal separation that creates separate buildings. By
default, this new second paragraph under the NFPA
13R requirements is also applicable to the number
of stories of Group R occupancies above a podium
structure when the entire structure is sprinklered per
NFPA 13. For example, an R-2 occupancy of Con-
struction Type IIIA, sprinklered per NFPA 13, can
be five stories above the Type IA pedestal below as
long as the overall building height from grade plane
does not exceed 85 feet (IBC Table 504.3)

IBC 1011.12 Exception
“Stairway to Roof”

New
Exception

Decrease

For stairways in buildings > four stories above
grade plane that do not have an occupied roof or
elevator equipment on the roof, access to the roof
does not need to be by one of the stairways in the
building. It can be provided by an alternating tread

device, a ship’s ladder or a permanent ladder.

IBC 1011.16 “Ladders”

New Provision

Decrease

New section with specific requirements for perma-
nent ladders. Such ladders cannot serve as a part of
the means of egress from occupied spaces within a
building.




S

Important Changes to the 2015 1BC (cont’d}

Section(s) and Issuels)

Tvpe of Change

Cost
fmplicarion

Comment

IBC 1016.2(1) “Egress
through Intervening Spac-
es,” 3006.4 Means of
Egress”

New Provision

Decrease

Exit access is permitted through an enclosed eleva-
tor lobby that leads to at least one of the required
exits. Exit access to not less than one of the other
required exits shall be provided without travel
through the enclosed elevator lobby.

IBC 1023.3.1 Exception 2
“Interior Exit Stairway
Extension”

New Provision

Decrease

An exit stairway does not require a door at the
stairway opening into an exit passageway if the exit
passageway has no other openings into it from the
building.

IBC 1107.4 Exceptions 3
and 4 “Accessible Route”

New Provision

Decrease

Exceptions added to exempt, in certain cases, acces-
sible stories and mezzanines in buildings with
Group R-2 units or dormitories if accessibility is
provided to other facilities.

Previous 2012 IBC Section
3004 “Hoistway
Venting”

Deleted

Decrease

The hoistway venting requirements have been de-
leted from the 2015 IBC since they were antiquated
and wasted building energy. Only Section 3004.3.1,
“Plumbing and Mechanical Systems,” was retained,
and it was relocated to Section 3002.9

IBC 101.4.7 “Existing
Buildings,” Previous 2012
IBC Chapter 34 “Existing
Buildings”

Deleted 2012
IBC Chapter 34

None

The requirements (Chapter 34) for existing struc-
tures have been removed from the 2015 IBC. All
existing construction requirements are now in the
2015 International Existing Building Code (IEBC).

IBC 104.11 “Alternative
Materials, Design, and
Methods of Construction
and Equipment”

Revision

None

Last sentence was added that requires the code offi-
cial to provide in writing the reasons why the alter-
native was not approved if he/she rejects the appli-
cation for an alternative design under this section of
the Code.

903.3.1.2.2 “Open-Ended
Corridors”

New Provision
— Correlation

None

This new section was added to the sprinkler re-
quirements just to clarify that when applying the
open-ended corridor (i.e., open breezeway) sprin-
kler requirements of Section 1027.6 Exception 3.1
to a building sprinklered in accordance with NFPA
13R, it is the intent of the IBC Code to also require
the open-ended corridors and its associated exterior
stairs to be sprinklered when using Exception 3 of
Section 1027.6.

903.3.5 “Water Supplies”

Revision

None

New last sentence in section was added to clarify
that the fire flow test for the design of the sprinkler
system needs to be adjusted for seasonal and daily
pressure fluctuations.

IBC 907.2.11.4 “Smoke
Alarms Near Bathrooms™

New Provision

None

Smoke alarms are to be located a minimum of three
feet from the bathroom door when the bathroom
contains a bathtub or shower.




Ldisadd

o

Important Changes to the

HEIBC (cont’d)

Section(s) and Issuels)

Type of Change

Cost
Implication

onunent

IBC 907.2.11.3 and
907.2.11.4 “Single and
Multiple-Station Smoke
Alarms Near Cooking
Appliances”

New Provision -
Correlation

None

These new sections were added to the alarm re-
quirements to correlate with the requirements in
NFPA 72 on the placement of smoke alarms. When
ionization smoke alarms are to be installed they
shall be placed a minimum of 20 feet from cooking
devices, or a minimum of 10 feet if they have an
alarm-silencing switch. If photoelectric smoke
alarms are to be installed they shall be placed a
minimum of six feet from cooking devices.

IBC Table 1006.2.1 “Spaces
with One Exit or Exit Ac-
cess Doorway”

New Provision

None

Combined 2012 IBC Tables 1014.3 and 1015.1 into
a single table for user-friendliness. Note that Table
1006.2.1 covers the maximum common path of
egress travel distance to that point where the occu-
pants have separate access to two exits (or are al-
ready outside the building), whereas Table 1017.2
covers the total exit access travel distance to an exit.

IBC 1006.2.1, Exception 1,
Table 1006.3.2(1) and
1006.3.2 Single Exits in
Buildings

Revised

None

It is permitted for multiple dwelling units, in groups
of four units or less per floor, to have access to a
single means of egress. The change also reflects the
revised travel distance for single exit design allow-
ing a maximum common path of egress travel dis-
tance of 125 feet.

IBC Section 915 “Carbon
Monoxide (CO)
Detection”

Relocated to its
Own

Section in
Chapter 9,
Reformatted
and Revised

None

The CO alarm requirements that were new in the
2012 IBC and located in Section 908.7 have been
relocated and extensively revised and clarified in
the 2015 IBC. A CO alarm is to be installed outside
of each separate sleeping area in the immediate vi-
cinity of the bedrooms in R-2 occupancies that have
fuel-burning appliances/fireplaces and/or attached
private garages. Buildings with open parking gar-
ages complying with Section 406.5 or enclosed
parking garages complying with Section 406.6 are
not considered private garages.

IBC 1010.1.7, Exception #2
“Thresholds at Doorways”

New Provision

None

In Type B dwelling units that permit a four -inch
elevation change at the door, the threshold height on
the exterior side of the door shall not exceed 4%” in
height above the exterior deck, patio or balcony for
sliding doors and not more than 4)%” for other
doors.

IBC 1210.2.3 “Shower
Compartments”

Revised

None

The height of the required nonabsorbent surface has
been raised from 70 inches to 72 inches.




L s

5

Important Changes to the 20158 IBC (cont’d)

Section(s) and Issue(s) Type of Change | Cost Comment
Implication

IBC 1405.3 “Vapor Revised None Requirements for vapor retarders have been modi-

Retarders” fied. In Climate Zones 1 and 2, Class I and II vapor
retarders are not permitted on the interior side of
frame walls. In Climate Zones 3 and 4, Class I va-
por retarders are not permitted on the interior of
frame walls. Class III vapor retarders are required
in specific locations.

IBC 3104.5 Connections of | Makes Code None Revised, reformatted section with no intended

Pedestrian Walkway to More User changes to the existing requirements.

Buildings” Friendly

IBC Section 3006 New Section None The elevator lobby requirements that were located

“Elevator Lobbies and with Relocated in 2012 IBC Section 713.14.1 were reformatted and

Hoistway Opening Requirements relocated into newly created Sections 3006.2 and

Protection 3006.3 in the 2015 IBC.

IBC 403.3.3 “Sprinkler Sec- | Relocated None Sprinkler systems in high-rise buildings in Seismic

ondary Water Supply” Design Category C, D, E or F are required to have a
secondary water supply.

IBC 202 Definition of “Cor- | New Provision | Unknown New design option protecting the ceiling mem-

ridor Damper,” 717.3.2.4 brane’s HVAC penetrations for a fire-rated exit ac-

“Corridor Damper Rating,” cess corridor where the ceiling of the corridor is

717.3.3.5 “Corridor Damper constructed using a fire-rated corridor wall assem-

Actuation,” 717.5.4.1 Ex- bly placed horizontally.

ception #1 “Where Re-

quired-Corridors”

IBC 602.4 Cross-Laminated | New Provision | Unknown Revisions allow the use of fire-retardant-treated

Timber Use in Construction lumber, cross-laminated timber and glued-laminated

Type IV plank in specific applications.

IBC 703.2.4 Fire-Resistance | New Provision | Unknown When a listed fire resistance assembly is modified,

Ratings and Fire Tests: Sup- sufficient data shall be made available to the code

plemental official to show that the required fire resistance rat-

Features” ing is not reduced.

IBC 705.2 “Projections,” Major Change Unknown Table 705.2, “Minimum Distance of Projections,”

705.2.3 “Combustible Pro- was modified and simplified and now requires an

jections” increase in the separation required between the
leading edge of a building’s projection and the
property line (or fire separation distance line). Sec-
tion 705.2.3 was simplified and requires added pro-
tection where a combustible projection is within 5’
of a property line (or FSD).

907.2.11.7 “Smoke Detec- New Provision | Unknown Clarifies that an acceptable alternative to providing

tion System”

single and multiple-station smoke alarms is to use
smoke detectors, listed per UL 268, that are part of
the building’s fire alarm system.




PUSTTRTR RN

1O

Tmportant Changes to the 2015 IBC (cont’d)

Section(s) and Issuefs) Type of Change | Cost Comnent
implication
913.2.2 “Circuits New Provision | Unknown New section requires that the power supply cables
Supplying Fire Pumps” shall be listed and installed in accordance with UL
2196.

IBC 1019 Exception 3, “Exit | New Provision | Unknown New provisions for exit stairways and ramps require
Access Stairways and enclosed stairways and ramps with exception for
Ramps” interior of dwelling units.

IBC 308.3 “Group I-1,” Major Unknown There have been a number of requests for conver-
308.3.1 “Condition 1, 308.3.2 | Changes for sions of existing R-2 projects into assisted living
“Condition 2,” 404.5 Excep- | I-1 facilities as the baby boomers are now in their 60s.
tion “Smoke Control,” 420.4. | Occupancies To provide some general guidance to firms that may

“Smoke Barriers in Group I-1,
Condition 2,” 420.5 “Auto-
matic Sprinkler System,”
420.6 “Fire Alarm Systems
and Smoke Alarms,” 709.5
Exceptions “Openings,”
903.2.6 Exception 1 “Group
1,7 903.3.2(3) “Quick-
response and Residential
Sprinklers,” 904.13 “Domes-
tic Cooking Systems in Group
I-2 Condition 1,” 907.2.6
Group I Manual Fire Alarm,”
907.2.11.2 “’Smoke Alarms,”
907.2.11.5 “Interconnection
of Smoke Alarms,” 907.2.13
Exception 6 “High-Rise
Buildings,” 907.5.2.2 Excep-
tion “Emergency Voice/Alarm
Communications,”
907.5.2.3.2 “Group I-1 Visi-
ble Alarms,” 909.5.3 Excep-
tion 3 and 909.5.3.1 “Smoke
Barrier Opening Protection,”
915.1.1 “CO Detection,”
1010.1.9.6 “Controlled Egress
Doors in Group I-1 and I-2,”
1010.1.9.8 “Sensor Release of
Electrically Locked Egress
Doors,” 1010.1.9.9 “Electro-
magnetically Locked Egress
Doors,” 1020.1 Exception 2
“Corridor Construction,” Ta-
ble 1020.1 “Corridor Fire-
Resistance Rating,” 3006.2(2)
“Hoistway Opening Protec-
tion Required”

be considering either the construction of new pro-
jects or conversion of existing buildings to such
occupancies, the two rows on I-1 and R-4 occupan-
cies are provided showing the revised requirements
in the 2015 IBC for these occupancies.

Also be aware that there may be modifications to
the requirements in the 2015 IBC that relate to an
existing building’s conversion to another occupan-
cy. See the requirements in the 2015 International
Existing Building Code (IEBC), Chapter 10,
“Change of Occupancy”.

Assisted living facilities (> 17 persons) are now
divided into two conditions with different require-
ments throughout the Code. I-1 Condition 1 only
applies to occupants who are capable of responding
to an emergency without any assistance to leave the
building. I-1 Condition 2 applies to occupants who
will require limited verbal or physical assistance to
respond to an emergency and safely egress from the
building.




-

Important Changes to the 2015 IBC {cont’d)}

Section{s) and Issuels)

Type of Change

Cost
Dmplication

Comment

Chapter 10 “Means of
Egress”

Major
Revisions, Re-
locations and
Clarifications

Unknown

2012 IBC Sections 1015 and 1021 requirements
were relocated and revised into the general provi-
sions of Sections 1006 and 1007. All the section
numbers that were in the 2012 IBC have been
changed in the 2015 IBC because of the extensive
reorganization and revisions during this code cycle.
Users of the Code are cautioned to do an extensive
review of Chapter 10 before designing a project
under this new edition of the Code.

IBC 1007 “Exit and Exit
Access Doorway
Configuration”

New Provision

Unknown

New section with specific requirements on how to
measure the separation distance between exits, exit
access doorways/stairways and ramps.

IBC 1015.7 Exception
“Roof Access”

New
Exception

Unknown

Exception eliminates the guards required for roof
access where the roof hatch opening is located with-
in 10’ of the roof edge or the open side is located >
30” above the floor, roof or grade above, where
permanent fall arrest/restraint anchorage connector
devices complying with ANSI/ASSE Z 359.1 are
provided.

IBC 2406.4.7 “Safety Glaz-
ing Adjacent to the Bottom
Stairway Landing”

Revision

Unknown

Requires safety glazing if glazing is located < 60”
above the bottom of a stair, or within a 60” horizon-
tal arc if < 180 degrees from the bottom tread nos-
ing.

IBC 111.1 “Use and
Occupancy”

Revision

Increase

A change in a building use, or portion thereof, with
no change in its occupancy classification will now
require a new Certificate of Occupancy.

IBC 716.5.8.4 “Opening
Protectives—Safety
Glazing”

Revision

Increase

Previous editions of the Code only required safety
glazing for “fire protection-rated” glazing in fire
door assemblies, now it will be required also for
“fire resistance-rated” glazing in fire door assem-
blies. Note that Section 716.5.8.1.1 provides the
locations where “fire resistance-rated” glazing in
fire door assemblies can be used, and Section
716.5.8.1.2 provides the requirements where “fire
protection-rated” glazing in fire door assemblies
can be used.

903.3.8 “Limited Area
Sprinkler Systems”

Major
Revisions

Increase

In existing, non-sprinklered apartment buildings,
limited area sprinkler systems were mostly provided
in basements where storage rooms, boiler rooms
and similar spaces were located. Revisions reduced
the number of sprinklers from 20 to six that can be
used on a “limited area sprinkler system” in any
single fire area. In addition, it now requires hydrau-
lic calculations to be done to show that these sprin-
klers that are piped off the domestic water supply
can control a fire.




bt

s

it b s

~

Important Changes to the 2015 IBC {cont’d)

Section(s) and Issuels)

Type of Change

Cost
Implication

Corpment

IBC 907.2.9.3 “Alarm Sys-
tems - Group R-2

College and University
Buildings”

Clarification

Increase

In the previous edition of the IBC, the alarm re-
quirements of this section appeared to apply to
buildings that are owned by a college or university.
For the 2015 IBC it was clarified that this require-
ment was for Group R-2 occupancies that are
«...operated by a college or university for student or
staff housing...” Requires an automatic smoke de-
tection system in the common corridors/spaces,
laundry, mechanical equipment and storage rooms.
It also requires the smoke alarms in the dwell-
ing/sleeping units to be interconnected with the fire
alarm system

IBC 1015.8 “Window Open-
ing Guard
Protection”

New Provision

Increase

Window openings more than 72” above grade that
are less than 36” above the floor must be protected
with guards or fixed openings that will not allow the
passage of a four-inch-diameter sphere.

IBC 1107.6.2.1 “Live/Work
Units”

New Provision

Increase

The nonresidential portion of a live/work unit is
required to be accessible. The entire live/work unit
is required to be accessible if the residential portion
of the live/work unit is required to be a Type B
dwelling unit.

IBC 1107.7.2 Multistory
Type B Dwelling Units

New Provision

Increase

The primary entry level in a multistory Type B
dwelling unit that is served by an elevator must
have a living area, kitchen and toilet facility.

IBC 1110.2.2, 1110.2.3 and
1110.4.13, Exception 3.
“Accessible

Recreational Facilities”

New Provision

Increase

New requirement that apartment properties comply
with ANSI A117.1 recreational facility require-
ments. Accessible means of entry into a swimming
pool, spa or similar water feature is not required in
R-2, R-3 and R-4 occupancies.

IBC 1203.2 “Attic
Ventilation”

New Provision

Increase

The ventilation requirements for attics have been
upgraded to reflect the new code requirements for
energy conservation. Specific requirements have
been added for enclosed attics and a new section
(IBC 1203.3) has been added for unvented attic and
unvented enclosed rated assemblies.

IBC Chapter 17 “Special
Inspections and Tests”

New Provision
and Revised

Increase

New requirements for special testing have been
added detailing specific requirements that must be
complied with when special inspection is required.
Requirements for inspection of specific materials
have been modified or added.




Important Changes to the 2015 [FC

Rise — Retroactive
Automatic Sprinkler
Requirement”

Sectien(s) and Issue(s) Type of Change | Cost Conmment
Implication
IFC 1103.3.2 Elevator New Provision | Decrease New exception to requirements for updating eleva-
Emergency Operation tors to latest standard which include installation of
protective doors, sprinkler protection, and for
freight elevators sprinkler protection provided at
least one elevator complies with A 17.3.
IFC 1104.22(4) “Means of Deletion of Decrease Remainder of Section 1104.21 was moved to
Egress for Existing 2012 IFC 1104.22. The requirement to retroactively sprinkler
Buildings—Exterior Stairway | Section existing, open-ended corridor (i.e., open breezeway)
Protection” 1104.21(4.1) buildings was deleted.
IFC 1103.7.6 Exception 4 New Decrease Exception 4 eliminates the requirement for a manu-
“Manual Fire Alarm Exception al fire alarm system in an existing R-2 occupancy
System in Existing Group where all four requirements are met:
R-2 Occupancies” 1. Building is < three stories in height above
grade plane.
2. Dwelling units are not served by interior cor-
ridors.
3. Dwelling units are separated from each other
by 3/4 hour fire barriers.
4. Dwelling units are provided with smoke
alarms per Section 907.2.11.
IFC Appendix B B105 “Fire | Revisions Unknown If a jurisdiction adopts the IFC and makes Appendix
Flow Requirements for B mandatory in the adopting ordinance, then fire
Buildings” flows for townhouses and other buildings can be
reduced based on the construction type and sprin-
kler system installed (NFPA 13, NFPA 13R or
NFPA 13D).
IFC Appendix C “Fire Revisions Unknown If a jurisdiction adopts the IFC and makes Appendix
Hydrant Locations and C mandatory in the adopting ordinance, then the
Distribution” revisions to Sections C103.2 Exception and C104.1
provide increased spacing for existing fire hydrants
and credit for existing fire hydrants on adjacent
properties that can be used. Also new footnotes “f”
and “g” permit fire hydrant spacing increases based
on the type of sprinkler system installed in the
building.
IFC Appendix L “Fire New Provision | Increase If a jurisdiction adopts the IFC and makes Appendix
Fighter Air Replenishment L mandatory in the adopting ordinance, then build-
Systems (FARS)” ings required by the local adopting ordinance to
have FARS would be required to comply with Ap-
pendix L’s design, installation, testing and mainte-
nance requirements.
IFC Appendix M “High- New Provision | Increase If a jurisdiction adopts the IFC and makes Appendix

M mandatory in the adopting ordinance, then all
existing high-rise buildings in that jurisdiction will
be required to be sprinklered.




Section(s) and Issuels) Type of Cost Comment
Change Implication

IEBC 406.3 and 702.5 - New Provision | Decrease Under the Prescriptive Compliance Method or Lev-

“Replacement Window el 1 Alterations, the replacement window must be

Emergency Escape and Res- the largest standard size that will fit within the ex-

cue Openings” isting frame.

IEBC 803.6 “Fire- New Provision | Decrease Under Level 2 Alterations, in buildings where an

Resistance Rating” automatic sprinkler system is installed throughout,
the required fire resistance rating of building ele-
ments and materials can be reduced to meet the
requirements of the current building code.

IEBC 706 “Reroofing” New Provision | Unknown Under Level 1 Alterations, requirements from 2015
IBC Section 1511 were also placed in the IEBC.

2012 IBC Chapter 34 has Editorial None The 2015 IEBC applies to repair, alteration, and

been deleted and all of the change of occupancy, additions, and relocations of

requirements for existing buildings.

existing buildings are now

found in the 2015 IEBC

IEBC 906.2 Alterations New Provision | None Revised to clarify that where four or more Group I-

Level III - Clarification 1, I-2, R-1, R-2, R-3 or R4 dwelling or sleeping
units are be altered, the requirements of Section
1107 of the IBC for Type B units and Chapter 9 of
the IBC for visible alarms apply only to the spaces
being altered. Exception: Group I-1, I-2, R-1, R-2,
R-3 and R-4 dwelling or sleeping units where the
first certificate of occupancy was issued before
March 15, 1991 are not required to provide Type B
dwelling or sleeping units.

IEBC 406.2 and 702.4 - New Provision | Increase Under the Prescriptive Compliance Method or Lev-

Replacement Window Fall el 1 Alterations, requirements for limits on window

Protection openings, similar to those for new construction, are
required for replacement windows. Window open-
ings more than 72 inches above the exterior grade
and less than 36 inches above the finished floor are
required to have control devices that limit the open-
ing so that a four-inch sphere will not pass.

IEBC 904.2 Fire Alarm Sys- | New Provision | Increase Install fire alarm and detection system with any

tem - Alteration
Level 3

Level 3 alteration.




Important Changes to the 2015 IPC
Sectionls) and Issue(s} Fype of Change | Cost Comment
Implication
IPC 106.1.1 “Annual Per- New Provision | Decrease An annual permit for plumbing repairs can be is-

mit”

sued to a person, firm or corporation to perform
plumbing work on individual plumbing items that
have already been approved when they employ a
qualified tradesperson.

Important Changes fo the 2018 1ECC

Section(s) and Issuels) Fype of Change | Cost Conunent
Implication

IECC C402 and Chapter 5 Revision Decrease Allow component performance design options for

Performance wall, floor, roof and other systems using overall

Compliance Options building insulation values to reduce insulation val-
ues in individual components.

IECC C504.2.3 Roof Cover- | Revision Decrease Exemption for repair/replacement of roof recover-

ing Air Barrier ing from the requirement for an air barrier.

TIECC C406 and Chapter 5 Revision Unknown Additional choices for required additional energy

Energy Efficiency efficiency packages that can be more cost-effective

Packages for new and existing buildings.

IECC Tables C402.1, No Change Increase from | The R-value and corresponding U-value tables for

C402.4, R402.1.2 and from the 2012 the 2009 the commercial and residential requirements have

R402.1.4-R-values and U- IECC IECC not been changed (except roof insulation), and are

values the same as in the 2012 versions of the IECC which
are not cost effective. See separate document, Rec-
ommended Amendments to the 2015 International
Energy Conservation Code (IECC), for more in-
formation.

IECC R402.4.1.2-Thermal | No Change Increase from | The residential Section R402.1.2 requires that the

Envelope Air Barrier Testing | from the 2012 the 2009 air barrier be pressure tested in accordance with a

IECC IECC test method for one- and two-family dwellings that

is not appropriate for R-2 occupancies. See sepa-
rate document, Recommended Amendments to the
2015 International Energy Conservation Code
(IECC), for more information.

IECC Commercial and Res- | Revisions and Increase The Commercial portions, which apply to R-2 oc-

idential Provisions Editorial cupancies four-or-more stories in height; and the
Residential portions, which apply to R-2 occupan-
cies three-or-less stories in height, have major revi-
sions to text which need to be considered during the
design process.

IECC C403.3.2.1 and Chap- | Revision Increase Increased hot water piping insulation levels with

ter 5

limits on lengths of hot water piping.




VA

s

Important Changes to the 2018 IECC (cont’d)

Secrion{s) and Issue(s) Type of Change | Cost Contmnent
Fmplication
IECC Table C403.2.3(9) Revision Increase Increased stringency of computer room HVAC min-
Minimum Efficiency Air imum efficiency levels.
Conditioners and
Condensing Units Serving
Computer Rooms
IECC C403.2.4.7 Fault De- | New Provision | Increase Required inclusion of a fault detection and diagnos-
tection tics reporting system on all 4.5 ton or larger air-
cooled, HVAC systems.
IECC C403.2.6.2 Garage New Provision | Increase Mandatory installation of automatic garage con-
Ventilation Controls trols.
IECC C405 and Chapter 5 New Provision | Increase Additional more stringent requirements for day-
Lighting Controls lighting, lighting controls and allowed lighting
power densities in new and existing buildings.
IECC C408.2.5.2.6 New Provision | Increase Lighting contractor required to provide operations
Lighting Operation and and maintenance manuals for lighting and lighting
Maintenance Manuals controls.
IECC C408.3.1 Occupant Revision Increase Requirement for functional testing of occupant sen-
Sensor Controls sor controls and time-switch controls.
IECC Chapter 5 Existing New Provision | Increase New Chapter 5, Existing Structures with provisions
Buildings for existing buildings in addition to those contained
in the IEBC.

Important Changes to the 20158 IMC

Section(s) and Issnefs) Type of Change | Cost Comment
Imiplication
IMC 106.1.1 “Annual Per- New Provision | Decrease An annual permit for mechanical repairs can be
mit” issued to a person, firm or corporation to perform
mechanical work on individual mechanical system
or equipment that has already been approved when
they employ a qualified tradesperson.
IMC 403.3.2 Mechanical New Provision | Increase Ventilation requirements for R-2 occupancies three
Ventilation stories or less in height have been completely re-

vised to include requirements for inclusion of me-
chanical exhaust and supply for each dwelling unit.




17

-4

i
3
3
3

Important Changes to the

b
ol
st
8%
oy
»

B
N

Section(s) and Issue(s) Type of Cost Comment
Change implication

IFGC 307.6 A/C New Provision | Increase Condensation pumps located in attics, crawl spaces

Condensation Pumps and other uninhabited spaces must have controls
that shut down the appliance upon failure of the
pumping system.

[FGC 404.7 "Protection New Provision | Increase Provisions added to protect concealed piping from

Against Physical penetration by nails, screws and other fasteners.

Damage”




Attachment 2

Summary of Significant Changes from 2012 to 2015 International Energy Conservation Code
Adapted from an email written by Darren Meyers (energy code consultant to the State of Illinois)

1)  Executive-level summary of 2015 IECC Residential Provisions with amendments for lllinois

a. New homes built to the 2015 IECC are projected to save new home buyers in lllinois 1.0 percent in
annual site energy usage, and 0.7 percent in annual energy costs compared with homes built to the
2012 IECC.

b. lllinois amendment eliminates the requirement for 0.40 SHGC for lllinois Climate Zone 5A (i.e.,
Springfield and North) for consistency with a similar non-requirement for Illinois Climate Zone 4A (South
of Springfield).

c. Illinois amendment allows basement wall insulation to be either: 1) R-13/R-10ci full-height, or 2)
R-19/R-15ci (half-height).

d. lllinois amendment requires Whole House Ventilation (WHV) “flow verification” through testing

prior to approval of a WHV system.

e. A new alternative compliance path is added based on an Energy Rating Index (ERI). While this
change does not directly alter stringency of the code, it does provide an additional compliance path as
an alternative to the IECC prescriptive and performance paths.

f. New Appendix ‘RA’ provides informative provisions for conducting a Combustion Air Zone (CAZ)
test to confirm whether homes are designed to provide acceptable levels of combustion air to
atmospherically-vented appliances. Because the appendix is non-mandatory, there is no direct impact
on residential energy efficiency.

g. New Appendix ‘RB’ provides informative provisions to ensure homes are “solar-ready.” Because
the appendix is non-mandatory, there is no direct impact on residential energy efficiency.

h.  Duct insulation requirements for return ducts in attics increased from R-6 to R-8.

i Heated water circulation systems and heat trace systems shall be controlled by demand-activated
circulation systems.

j- All %-inch hot-water pipes shall be insulated to R-3.

k.  Historic buildings, which are generally exempted from the code, to comply with any of the code’s
provisions for which there is no “compromise to the historic nature and function of the building.”

I Outdoor reset control for hot water boilers requires boiler water temperature be lower when
outdoor temperature is higher.

2)  Executive-level summary of 2015 IECC Commercial Provisions with amendments for lllinois

a. New commercial buildings constructed to the 2015 IECC are projected to save commercial building
owners and operators 11.1 percent in annual site energy usage and 11.5 percent in annual energy costs
on a national aggregated basis compared to commercial buildings constructed to the 2012 IECC.



Wit s

b. Three new “efficiency package” options added to the original three, making six (6) options, of
which one must be selected for ALL new commercial buildings:

i.  Improved HVAC equipment performance (Section C406.2),
ii. Reduced lighting power density (LPD) system (Section C406.3),
iii. Enhanced lighting controls (Section 406.4),
iv.  On-site supply of renewable energy (Section C406.5),

v. Adedicated outdoor air system for certain HVAC equipment
(Section C406.6), and

vi. High-efficiency service water heating (Section C406.7).
C. Flat-roof insulation levels “above deck” increased from R-25ci to R-30ci.

d. Hot Water Boilers shall be provided with temperature reset controls that automatically lowers the
boiler water supply temperature setpoint based on outdoor air temperature.

e. Energy recovery ventilation (ERV) requirements in Table C403.2.7(1) reduce the OA fraction
threshold to 10% in lllinois climate zones 4A and 5A.

f. New requirements for all kitchen exhaust and kitchen make up air systems based on recognized
hood and canopy exposure types.

g. DX units that control 75,000 Btu/h or more of rated capacity require at least two stages of
mechanical cooling capacity.

h. Medium and Large Offices, Private Primary and Secondary Schools, Outpatient Healthcare, and
Hospitals will be able to reheat/recool more recirculation air for human comfort if it can be
demonstrated to reduce overall system annual energy use by offsetting reheat/recool energy losses
through reductions in outdoor air intake. <<Chicago Building Code on Ventilation trumps this>>

i. Multiple-zone VAV system ventilation optimization control requirements in Section C403.4.4.6.
Under this requirement, multiple-zone VAV systems shall have automatic controls to reduce outdoor air
intake flow from the design rates in response to dynamic system ventilation efficiency as defined by the
2015 International Mechanical Code (IMC).

j- Changes that will likely decrease the number of skylights in warehouses and strip-mall-retail from
2012 to 2015 IECC levels. The major impacts of these changes on energy performance of warehouses
and strip-mall-retail buildings are in envelope thermal performance, daylight responsive control, and
HVAC system sizing.

k.  Interior lighting power reductions. The IECC requirements related to the interior lighting power
were reduced across all building area types on average -19% (e.g., 2012 IECC “Office” LPD reduced from
0.9 to 0.82 W/ft2 in 2015 IECC).



‘ORD 20156177

The following is a general summa
April 24, 2014. To access the Code elecironically, visit www.il

JENERAL SUMMARY OF THE CHANG!

Attachment 3

S TO

THE ILLiNois PLumBing CopEe

Code under the Quick Links tab. The Hiinols PHCC will

provide mor

e detailed information as i is available.
£y 74 7 ir

ry of the changes to the Illinois Plumbing Code which became effective
phec.com and click on the Hiinois Plumbing

be printing code books in the near future and will

Date removed from Standard
except in the Tables

All sections

“Proper” replaced with”
Approved”;*Approptiate”
replaced with “the required”,
efc. General grammar and
style corrections.

Various sections

-applications. Supply fittings that discharge

SUBPART A

Changes “General Regulations” to “General
Provisions”.

890.110

Changed the name of the section from
“General Regulations” to “Applicability”.

890,120
Definitions

Circuit Vent; deleted “which depend on siphonage
for proper operation” from the definition.

Code; changed to use the official reference to the
Code. In reference to the local level, changed
“code” to “rule or ordinance”.

Confinuous Vent; deletes the sentence “A
continuous vent is also known as a back vent or an
individual vent”. :
CCCDY replaces the “Illinois BPA” with reference
fo the Title 35-rules.

Department; new definition referring to the Illinojs
Department of Public Health.

Drainage Fixture Unit; replaces “Fixture Unit,
Drainage™ Definition is the same.

Existing Work; changes the date ~ “A plumbing
system or any part of a plumbing system that has
been instatled prior to January 1, 20147,
Graywater; Definition changed to read “Unireated
waste waler that has not come into contract with
toilet waste, kitchen sink waste, dishwasher waste
or similarly contaminated sources. Graywater
includes waste water from bathtubs, showers,
lavatories, clothes washers and laundry tubs.

Also know as gray water, grey water, and

grey water”,

Individual Vent changed to Individual Dry

Vent. Changed to read; “a pipe installed to

vent a single fixture trap that connects

with the vent system above the fixture served,

or that terminates in the outside atmosphere”,
Added; See Appendix B. [llustration CC.

Island Fixture Vent; changed to read “a

vent in which the vent pipe rises as near as
possible to or above the highest water level in

the fixture vented and then turns down before
Lising to connect to the vent system

6 inches above the food level tim or

terminating 10 the atmosphere”.

- | sanitizing items™,

Kitehen or Bar Sink Faucet; new definition
- “a faucet that discharges into a kitchen
or bar sink in domestic or commercial

into other types of sinks, including, clinic
sinks, floor sinks, service sinks and faundry
trays are not included”.

Labeled; new definition — “an indication that
an agency approved by the Depariment or
that is an ANST-acoredited certification
program has certified the plumbing materia)
1o be in compliance with applicable standards
in accordance with this Part™.

Lavatory Faucet; new definition — *a

faucet that discharges into a lavatory basin in
a domestic or commercial installation”.
Lead Free; wording changed to meet the
2014 federal Safe Drinking Water Act.

Lioop Vent; deletes the phase “which depend
on self siphonage for proper operation”,
Main Vent; adds “a main vent may be a vent
stack or a stack vent”,

Metering Faucet; new definition — “a self
closing faucet that dispenses a specific
volume of water for each actuation cycle.
The volume or cycle duration can be fixed or
adjnstable”,

Multi-person Showers; “shower
corpartments designed and intended for use
by two or more persons simultaneously.
Non-Potable Water; corrects the standard
referenced. _
Pipe Increments; adds 1-1/4” to the list of
pipe sizes.

Potable Water; changed to read “water that
meets drinking water standards specified in
the Pollution Control Board’s rules titled
‘Primary Drinking Water Standards (35 111.
Adm. Code 611}, and is suitable for human
consumption or culinaty use™,

Pre-Rinse Spray Valve; new definition — “a
hand-held device for use with commiercial
dishwashing and ware-washing equipment
that sprays water on dishes, flatware, and
other food service items for the purpose of
removing food residue before cleaning and

Private Water Supply; deletes the reference
to the Illinois Groundwater Protection Act,
Self Closing Faucet; new definition — “a
faucet that closes itself after the actuation or
control mechanism is deactivated. The
actuation or control miechanism can be
mechanical or electronic™.

Water Closet; new definition — “a fixture
with a water-containing receptor that receives

TeLinots MasTer PLumser, July 2014 9




ORD 2015-6177

H
}

GENERAL SUMMARY OF THE CHANGES
TO THE [LLinois PLuMBING

Copg

Cmmwn

SO

liquid and solid body waste and on actuation
conveys the waste through an exposed integral
trap Into a drainage system. Also referred to ag a

890.640 c) 3)

Corrects the standard for bathtub liners/
inserts.

£90.340 ¢)

Corrects the standard for cast iron joints in
water supply pipe to AWWA Ci51.

toilet.” ) 890.650 f)  Adds; “Seats for accessible water closets may
Water Supply Rixture Unit; replaces Fixture be open or closed front, and may have a lid or
Unit, Water Supply. Definition is the same. not have a lid”.
890.130 Incorporated and Referenced Materials (List) 890.650 g)  {Corrects the standard for flushometer tank
valves,
890.140 Replages “Repairs and Alterations” with
“Compliance with This Part”, 890.680 ¢)  |Changes the standard reference from ASSE
) 1016 to 1070 on water temperature for
890.1405) 1 {Deletes part of the variance language. lavatories.
890.140b)2  [Adds; “The Department will consider variances 890.690 b) | Water temperature for showers; corrects the
to this Part when the applicant has provided standard ASSE 1016/ASME A112.1016/
documentation citing the particular portion of CSA BI125.16 and adds ASSE 1070. Changes
this Part for which a variance is sought and “gang” shower to “multi-person” shower.
has provided justification sufficient, in the
opinion of the Department, to demonstrate 890.700 d)  jAdds; “Service sinks, mop sinks, laundry
that the variance will not create a condition trays or similar utility sinks shall be provided
less protective than that portion of this Part with hot water™.
addressed in the vatiance request. Issuance
of variances to this Part is at the sole discretion 890,700 ¢)  |Adds: “Sinks in laboratories that are not
of the Department and may not be delegated or designated for hand washing or
assumed by any other authority identified in this personal hygiene may be supplied with cold
Part. Variance authorizations may be conditioned water only™. ’
as determined by the Department and are not
precedential”, 8§90.720 1)  |Adds the Illinois Safe Boitled Water Act to
) ) the requirernents. Deletes reference 10
890.180 ¢) & f) | Adds a note to see Appendix B. Hlustration BB. “IDPH’s Public Area Sanitary Practice Code™.
890.3201)3)  Joints in Plastic Drainage; adds “listed in Section 890.730b)  |Adds high-density polyethene (HDPE) to the
890. Appendix A. Table A. materials allowed for trench drains.
890.330 b) Corrects the standard to ASME B31.1. 890.750 Added “Hydromassage” in front of
Whirlpool.
§90.330 ¢) Stiaight stops are added for push-on stops. P
890.750b)  iCorvects the standards and addresses suction

fittings.

890.340 g) 1)

Plastic-Commingling; adds “or approved
solvent as listed in 890. Appendix A. Table A.
for connections transitioning from one
material to another, only.

890.410

Changed “Traps” to “Fixture Traps/
Continuous Waste™

890.510 2) 3)

Deletes the prohibiticn of discharging a
commercial dishwashing machine into the
grease interceptor.

890.810 a) 1)

Adds “Individual businesses within the same
building or within an enclosed mall may
share public or employee restroom facilities,
provided that the access to the restrooms does
not require trespass on adjoining businssses
or leased space. Restrooms shall be open

at al] times wheun any individual business
within the same building or within an
enclosed mall is open”.

Deletes the example given,

890.520 d) 3)

Gas & Oil Interceptors; “Two or more vents
may be connected 1o a header, which shall be
6 inches higher than the lowest floor or trench
drain served”.

890.8102) ) A) i

Changes the floor area per person for
“Asserably Places ~Facilities for Spectator
Events; Worship Places and Funeral Homes;
Museumns, Libraries;Exhibition Areas and
Similar Uses™ from 15 sq. ft. to 50 sq. fi.

890.520 4) 6)

Corrects Office of State Fire Marshal Code 1o
add 174, 175, 176, 177 and deletes 170.

890.630 ¢)

Adds; “Potahle” in front of “Water Supply
Connection™. '

890.1010 ¢)

Clear water wastes; adds “refrigerated cases”
and “vacum waste systems”.
Deletes “building sewer”.

10 Juwois Master Prumser, JuLy 2014




ORD 2015-6177

S

EN

I

0

ERAL SUMMARY OF THE CHANGES
THE L

Linois Puomeing Cope

18901120

Changes color for non-potable water marking from
yellow to continuous purple; changes the reference
to the correct standard,

890.1220 a) 89

Was 9), now 8).Added Z21.10.1 &
Z21.10.1b for space heating.

890.1130g) 7

Adds “with hot water storage™ to the section on
closed water systems with regards to backflow
devices.

890.12202)9) A)

POU water heaters; non-storage and non-
pressurized units are exempt from relief valve
requirements.

890.1140 h) D A)

Adds “and the water supply shall be protected -
against backflow and back siphonage by an air gap;
or an RPZ,

890.1140 h) 1) B)

Language changed to read “Chemical dispensing
units shall have a dedicated water supply and shut-
off valves to each unit. Bach unit shall have a
backflow device installed to protect against
backflow and back siphonage”.

890.1140 k)

Adds requirements for the usage of water
powered sump pumps.

890.1220 2 9) B) | POU water heaters; units intended to deliver
water 110 degrees or less shall have an
internal burnout element. Deletes the option
of a factory set thermostat. Units are exempt
from relief valve requirements.

890.1220 a) 10)

{New) Steam Heat.B) “All steamn heat exchangers

operating in excess of 15 psi, but less than 50
psi shall be separated by double wall
construction, with an air gap open to the
atinosphere between the two walls.”

890.1180 1) 3)

Changes the reference to labs certified for
watet testing.

290.12202) 10) C

Adds requirements for steam heat exchangers

890.1230 1) 2)

Replaces AGA with CSA

890.1310 a)

Adds “and clear water vacuum waste
systems” in reference to drainage materials,

890. 1190 1) {Requires a full port valve on inlet and outlet
side of the meter.

890.1190'b)  {Adds thata drain valve shall be installed on the
discharge side of the meter valve when located
inside of a building,

890.1190.d) |Requires that the valve in the cold water

branch to a water storage tank or each water heater
shall be within 5 developed feet of the tank or heater
and be located in the same room.

890.1320 a) | Requires all underground drainage systems to
be installed on wndisturbed earth or granular
{ill. Removes exemption for cast iron.

890.1340 a) | Adds design language for Drainage similar to

the requirements for Water Distribution. Also
changes CIPE to CPD.

890.1190¢) & )

“Shut off” replaced with “line” in reference to
valves.

890.1190 g)

Deletes “or back to back™ in reference 1o
valve requirements in health care facilities,

890.1340 b)Y 4)

Adds that the venting system is excluded
from the requirement that any piping
underground must be at least 2%

£890.1360a) 1)

Adds the words “sewage ejection” between
automatic.and “pumping”.

890.1370 a)

Removes “When plumbing fixtures are
installed on the level immediately above a
crawl space, at least one trapped and vented
floor drain shall be installed.”

890.1210a) |Adds “attic” to places where water pipes
cannot be run vnless provisions are made to
prevent freezing.

890.1210b) |Replaces “CIPE” with “CPD™.

890.1210 ) |Replaces “high pressure™ with “pressure

surges” . (Water Hammer)

890.1370 €) 1)

Deletes the requirement that floor drains in
food establishments must be metallic.

890.12204) 1)

Adds ‘the CSA” as an approved testing
agency for equipment used for heating and
storing hot water.

890.1370 €) 3)

Adds language to isolate these floor drains (in
food establishments) from other sanitary
discharge.

890.12202)2) A

Allows the use of a single wall construction
hot water heat exchanger in a solar system iff
a non-toxic transfer fluid is used. (2-5)
rearranges the current language on heat
exchangers.

890.1220 3) 8)

Language changed and moved New N for P-O-U
water heaters. Removed “instantaneocus™,

890.1420 a) | Added to {Vents) Design — “All fixture traps
shall be protected by the use of a vent or
venting system construeted in-accordance
with thiis Parl”.

890.1420 b) | Added to Installation — “Fixture Traps shall

be protected by the appropriate method as
follows: an individual dry vent, 2 wet vent, a
comumon vent, a circuit or loop vent, an island

vent, or a combination waste & vent system.”

1

ILLivois MasTER Prumser, Juiy 2014




ORD 2015-6177

GENERAL SUMMARY OF THE CHANGES
TO THE [Lunois Pruvsing Cop

SN

E

RS

26T

890.1420 ¢)

Vent Terminals; moved to 890.1430

890.1430 &)
{new d was ¢}

d) Adds that no vent terminal can be within 4 feet of
a vertical obstruction.

©) states that wet vents in an exterior wall or
adjacent to an unheated space must be protected
from freezing,

890.1450 b)

Vertical Rise; adds the following “Exception:
Wet venting and fidor drain vents may connect
horizontally.”

890.1450 d)

Deletes: “Horizontal kitchen sink vents shall be
above the flood level tim of the fixture”.

Venting Part

General Cleanup and Reorganization.

890.1720 a)

Corrects the Standard for Correction Facility Water
Closets.

890.1730 2)

Corrects the Standard for Correctional Facil; ty
Urinals.

850.1750 a)

Correct the Standard for Correctional Facility
Service Sinks.

890. Appendix A

Cleanup of addresses/listings on agencies/
organizations.

200 females to 1 for each 150.
Batheubs/Showers for Dormitories;
change in Footnote 13 now reads “The total
number of bathing facilities shall include
one bathtub for males and one bathtub for
females or ong individual user
restroom with a2 bathtub,
Drinking fountains for asserably places
(sports arenas, etc.).Adds High-Low to | per
each set of male and fernale restroors.
Drinking fountains for assembly places
(theaters, efc.). Adds; “! High-Low for
each set of male and female restrooms,
For Mercantile, malls, ete. it adds the same
language.
Water Closets for Mercantile, malls, ate,
Changes the over 800 requirement for females
from 1 for 175, to { for each 150.
Businesses Selling Motor Fuel. Adds
service sink where public restrooms are
reguired.
Office/Publie Buildings. Changes the water
closét tequirement for additional over 110
from I for each 46, to.1 for each 50. Changes
additional lavatories for over 125 people
from 1 for45, to 1 for 50.
Schools ~ Elementary and above, Day
Care,Nursery, ete. Adds to the requirement
for 1 service sink per floor “and kiichen area.’

Drinking fountains for facilities for employee use
changed from 1 per 7S to | per 100.

Other fixtures for single or multiple dwelling,
condo, or apt., hotel/motel; changed from 1 laundry
tray or clothes washer connection for each 4 units
to { for each 10 units.

Water closets for assembly places (sports arenas,

etc.) for over 800 people changed from ] for each

Appendix A. - -

Table A Updates standards for DWYV. Appendix A.
Adds: CPVC for chemical waste; Identification of Table D - o
Piping Systems; deletes steel, ,Ki\fhgum um Water Dist. ‘P;pf Size. ,fidds
Updates standards for Building Sewer. Adds: ‘Dishwasher (commercial) 3/4 inch S
HDPE pipe; Polypropylene Pipe; [dentification of 1 Kitchen sink (commcrc;al) 1 faucet Y2 inch :
Piping Systems. Kitchen sink (commercial) 2 faucets % inch”.
Updates standards for Water Service. Adds: ) .
Stainless Steel. Appendix A.
Updates standards for Water Distribution. Adds: Table M . ) )
Pex Distribution Systems & Joints; Stainless Steel. Load Values Assigned to Fixtures. Water
Updates standards for Fixtures & Fixture Fittings. Closets Public/Private, Flush Tank changed
Adds: enameled steel fixtures; trench drains; plastic from 5 to 3 WSFU. 3
urinals, Lav. Public, Faucet changed from L5tw01
Updates standards for Appliances/Appurtenances/ WSFU. Shower Head Public, Mixing Valve
Devices. Under mixing valves, adds: automatic changed from 3 to 2 WSFU. Service sink
compensating valves for individual showers and faucets, Office, etc. changed from 2.25 to 2.
tub/shower combinations; mixing valves for hot Shower stall mixing valve, private changed
water distribution; automatic temperatire control from 1.5 to 1. Laundry tray faucets, private
mixing valves; water temperature limiting devices; | changed from 2.25 to 2.
mixing valves for emergency equipment; T e
also aﬁdds; watet c[oscrtg pergongl g;giene devices; Drawings Cleanup and Clarification of all
water sofiner and treatment devices. Iostrations.

Appendix A.

Table B Minimum Number of Fixtures.

12 iimos Master Prumser, Jury 2014




Attachment 4

ILLINQIS

Illinois Department of
N atur al Reseurces ' Bruce Rauner, Governor

i One Natural Resources Way  Springficld, Tllinots 62702-1271 Wayne A. Rosenthal, Director
www.dnzillinois.gov

May 5, 2015

Dear Lake Michigan Water Allocation Permittees,

On March 31, 2015, the Department sent out an email requesting that all Lake Michigan Water
Allocation Permittees adopt and submit revised ordinances/building codes consistent with the
Department’s recently updated Lake Michigan Water Allocation Regulations; in particular, Section
3730.307 (c) subparts 4 and 8. The revised language includes a requirement that new and replacement
plumbing fixtures and irrigation controllers on sprinkler systems be a labeled WaterSense product, as
specified by the USEPA.

IDNR has coordinated with the Illinois Department of Public Health (IDPH) to ensure our rules are
consistent with IDPH’s rules implementing the Illinois Plumbing Code. IDNR and IDPH have crafted
sample ordinance language that will meet both requirements. The sample ordinance language reads as
follows:

Pursuant to 17 lll. Admin. Code 3730.307(c)(4) and subject to the lllinois Plumbing Code (77 Ill. Admin.
Code 890) and the Lawn Irrigation Contractor and Lawn Sprinkler System Registration Code (77 ill.
Admin. Code 892), be it hereby ordained that in the City/Village/County of XXXXX, all new plumbing
fixtures and irrigation controllers installed after the effective date of this ordinance shall bear the
WaterSense label (as designated by the U.S. Environmental Protection Agency WaterSense Program),
when such labeled fixtures are available.

Prior to adopting this ordinance, you must first submit it to the IDPH for their approval. An iDPH
submittal form and a description of the approval process are attached for your use. If your proposed
ordinance is consistent with the substance in the sample ordinance above, it should receive IDPH
approval.

In addition, all permittees are still required to adopt and submit a second ordinance consistent with the
Department’s revised language concerning non-essential outside water use (Section 3730.307 (c)(8)):

8) The adoption of ordinances that restrict non-essential outside water uses to prevent excessive,
wasteful use. These shall provide that unrestricted lawn sprinkling will not be allowed from May 15
through September 15 or each year by requiring, as a minimum, that lawn sprinkling shall not occur on

Please return this form, Attn: Cara Adkins, IDNR/OWR | cara.n.adkins@illinois.gov
Office of Water Resources | 160 N. LaSalle Street, Suite S-703 | Chicago, Illinois 60601
Office: 312.814.8579 | Fax: 312.793.5968



FLLINOIS

[llino1s Department of
N atur al Resuurces Bmce Rauner, Governor

I One Natural Resources Way  Springfield, lllinois 62702-1271 Wayne A. Rosenthal, Director
www.dnrillinols.gov

RESOURES

consecutive days nor shall any lawn sprinkling occur during at least a 6 hour period in the middle of the
day (i.e., 10 a.m. through 4 p.m., noon to 6 p.m.) when evapotranspiration is at its highest. New lawns
(less than 3 months old) may be exempted from this provision.

Adoption of an ordinance consistent with this language will not require prior approval of IDPH.

| apologize for any confusion and additional work this extra step will cause. All Lake Michigan water
allocation permittees that are units of local government should submit their revised ordinances to the
Department by September 30, 2015. If you have any questions, please contact Cara Adkins at
312.814.8579 or cara.n.adkins@illinois.gov.

James P. Casey

IDNR/OWR

Lake Michigan Management Section
160 N. LaSalle Street, Suite S-703
Chicago, IL 60601

(312) 793-5947

(312) 793-5968 fax
James.casey@illinois.gov

Please return this form, Attn: Cara Adkins, IDNR/OWR | cara.n.adkins@illinois.gov
Office of Water Resources | 160 N. LaSalle Street, Suite S-703 | Chicago, lllinois 60601
Office: 312.814.8579 | Fax: 312.793.5968




2014 NEC Changes _ Page 1 of 5

Attachment 5

Codes & Standards

Home (/en_us) ADVOCACY  Codes & Standards (/codes-and-standards)  Changes to the 2014 NEC

Changes to the 2014 NEC

According to the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA), there were 3,745 proposals
submitted recommending changes for the 2014 National Electric Code (NEC). In addition,
there were 1,625 comments concerning the NEC Code-Making Panels’ responses to these
proposals. Below are some of the more noteworthy changes that occurred in the 2014
edition of the NEC.

1. There was a revision to increase the nominal threshold voltage from 600 Volts to
1,000 Volts. The higher voltage is needed for the installation for solar PV equipment.

2. New Articles were added to the NEC topics concerning:

« Article 393 Low Voltage Suspended Ceiling Power Distribution
« Article 646 Modular Data Centers

« Article 728 Fire Resistive Cable Systems

« Article 750 Energy Management Systems

3. Even though “readily accessible” has been used in the NEC, the definition of readily
accessible has been added to article 100. This may require changes to the installation of
receptacles for dishwashers and vending machines.

Readily Accessible
Capable of being reached quickly for operation, renewal, or inspection without requiring
those concerned to use a tool, to climb over, remove obstacle, or other.

4. Article 210.8 GFCI Protection for Dwelling Unit Laundry Areas and Commercial
Garages

Dwelling unit laundry areas will now require GFCI protection for all 125-volt, single-
phase, 15- and 20 amp receptacles in laundry rooms.

http://www.ieci.org/codes-and-standards/2014_nec_changes 12/28/2015



2014 NEC Changes Page 2 of 5

GFCI protection required for all 125 volt single phase 15 and 20 ampere receptacles
installed in all commercial, non dwelling unit garages, service bays and similar areas.
Not only garages where electrical diagnostic equipment electrical hand tools, or
portable lighting equipment are to be used.

5. Article 210.8(D) GFCI for Kitchen Dishwasher Branch Circuit.

GFCI protection shall be provided for outlets that supply dishwashers installed in
dwelling units. This includes receptacles and hardwired (All GFCI’s must be readily
accessible).

6. Article 210.12 AFCI Protection for Dwelling Units now required in kitchen, laundry,
and dormitories.

Receptacle AFCI’s can be used under certain conditions.
7. Article 300.38 Raceways in Wet Locations Above Grade.

A new section was added to Part 1l (over 1000 volts, nominal) of Article 300 to indicate
that the interior of raceways installed in wet locations above grade are now considered
to be a wet location. This will bring aboveground installation requirements for over 1000
volts consistent with the requirements in 300.9 for 1000 volts and under.

8. Article 310.15(B)(3)(c), Exception and Table 310.15(B)(3)(c) Raceways and Cables
Exposed to Sunlight on Rooftops.

A new exception was also added that will allow the employment of Type XHHW-2
conductors, which is a thermoset insulated conductor, to be installed in raceways or
cables on rooftops without having to apply an ambient temperature adjustment
correction factor for these conductors.

9. There was a revision to article 406.9(B)(1) Extra-Duty Covers at 15- and 20-Ampere
for receptacles at wet locations.

10. There is a revision in Article 445.11 to require marking at generators to indicate if
the neutral is bonded to the frame.

11. Articles 517.18(B); 517.19(B); and 517.19(C) for healthcare facilities will conform to
NFPA 99 and change the number of receptacles in patient care facilities for the patient
and in operating rooms.

12. Article 690.12 will require Rapid Shutdown of PV Systems on Buildings.
These are just a few of the changes that have been incorporated into the new 2014 NEC.

For more information, contact John Masarick at (703) 650-0053 or e-mail
jmasarick@ieci.org. (mailto:jmasarick@ieci.org)

http://www.ieci.org/codes-and-standards/2014_nec_changes 12/28/2015



	Agenda Item 7_999 Sherwood Drive.pdf
	DOLD.pdf
	Page 1



